
 

CITY OF NOVI CITY COUNCIL 

APRIL 13, 2026 

 

 

SUBJECT: Approval to award the Sport Clothing and Apparel contract to Empire 

Printing, LLC for one (1) year with two (2) renewal options in one-year 

increments based on unit pricing.  

SUBMITTING DEPARTMENT: Parks, Recreation & Cultural Services  

 

KEY HIGHLIGHTS:  

 Apparel for PRCS Staff and Coaches 

 Awards for Sport League Winners 

 Budget Included in Program Expenses 

 

BACKGROUND INFORMATION:  

 

Parks, Recreation and Cultural Services (PRCS) purchases a variety of sport clothing 

and apparel throughout the year related to programs and staff; therefore, a 

comprehensive bid was developed.  

 

The bid includes t-shirts, sweatshirts, jackets, and other apparel purchased for various 

classes and programs, including those given as awards to sport league winners. This 

bid does not include sport league uniforms. Items related to the programs are 

budgeted as part of the expense for each program and are figured into the 

program price. Shirts for staff are also purchased throughout the year for site 

supervisors, seasonal staff and full-time staff, as needed, and are budgeted 

accordingly. Across all PRCS programming, $19,407.49 was spent in FY 23-24 and 

$18,014.45 was spent in FY 24-25 

 

After reviewing the ten bids received, staff are recommending Empire 

Printing, LLC, for sports clothing and apparel for one year, with two renewal options in 

one-year increments as they include the lowest prices on our most ordered items 

and are our current vendor. All shipping fees, no matter the order size, 

are included in the line-item costs of the Empire Printing bid. Included is the bid tab 

sheet along with the proposal of the recommended bidder.  

 

RECOMMENDED ACTION: Approval to award the Sport Clothing and Apparel contract 

to Empire Printing, LLC for one (1) year with two (2) renewal options in one-year 

increments based on unit pricing.  

























































CITY OF NOVI - SPORT CLOTHING APPAREL Bid due 3/25/26 2:00 p.m.

Item Description

Cole's

Screen Printing

Elohim Designs

and Creations Empire Printing Hilton Screeners
Impressive 

Professional Projects

SETUP/ARTWORK

1 Logo Setup/Artwork Dept/City 0.00 75.00 0.00 0.00 5.00

2 Logo Setup/Artwork Sponsor 0.00 75.00 0.00 0.00 5.00

PRINTING COSTS (per shirt)

3 1 color logo/1 location 2.43 2.25 0.75 2.75 1.00

4 2 color logo/1 location 2.93 2.50 1.00 3.25 1.50

5 1 color logo/2 location 3.85 4.00 1.50 5.10 2.00

6 2 color logo/2 location 5.05 4.50 2.00 6.25 3.50

7 "Coach", "Supervisor", "Staff" 1.75 1.50 0.75 3.00 1.00

EMBROIDERY COSTS (per logo)

8 Embroidered logo - 1 color 5.00 6.00 5.50 12.00 7.50

9 Embroidered logo - 2 color 5.00 8.00 5.50 12.00 7.50

10

Embroidered logo - 1 color, on 

customer supplied item 5.00 12.00 6.50 12.00 9.50

11

Embroidered logo - 2 color, on 

customer supplied item 5.00 15.00 6.50 12.00 9.50

ADULT SOFTBALL/COACHSTAFF

12 T-Shirts, SS, 50/50 cotton/poly Gildan 8000 n/a Gildan 8000 Gildan 8000 Port & Co. PC55

 Youth Small - Youth XL 3.50 3.96 4.15 6.00

Adult Small - Adult XL 3.60 3.96 4.15 6.00

Adult 2XL 5.35 5.96 6.75 8.00

Adult 3XL 6.60 6.96 8.70 11.00

Adult 4XL 6.60 7.96 8.70 11.00

13 T-shirts, LS, 50/50 cotton/poly Port & Co PC55LS Port & Co PC55 Gildan 8400 Gildan 8400 Port & Co PC55LS

Adult Small - Adult XL 6.79 5.50 7.81 8.40 11.00

Adult 2XL 7.74 6.64 9.81 10.75 12.00

Adult 3XL 8.59 8.26 10.81 13.95 13.50

Adult 4XL 8.59 8.26 11.81 13.95 13.50

14 T-shirt - SS, 100 % poly, wicking Augusta 790 Augusta 790 Augusta 790 Augusta 790 Augusta 790

Adult Small - Adult XL 5.75 5.74 6.03 5.45 6.50

Adult 2XL 5.75 9.16 8.03 5.45 6.50

Adult 3XL 8.60 10.72 9.03 9.65 11.50



CITY OF NOVI - SPORT CLOTHING APPAREL Bid due 3/25/26 2:00 p.m.

Item Description

Cole's

Screen Printing

Elohim Designs

and Creations Empire Printing Hilton Screeners
Impressive 

Professional Projects

15 T-shirt - LS, 100% poly, wicking Augusta 788 Augusta 788 Augusta 788 Augusta 788 Augusta 788

Adult Small - Adult XL 7.94 10.00 10.61 8.65 10.50

Adult 2XL 7.94 11.86 12.61 8.65 10.50

Adult 3XL 10.79 14.51 13.61 12.80 15.50

16 Polo, SS 

Nike 

373749/354064 Nike 373746/354064 Nike 373749/354064 n/a Nike NKDC1963/1993

Adult Small - Adult XL 16.76 20.55 20.94 42.00

Adult 2XL 17.46 25.55 22.94 44.00

Adult 3XL (no ladies) 18.96 n/a 23.94 47.50

Adult 4XL(no ladies) 19.76 n/a 24.94 49.00

17 Sweatshirt - Crew Neck (8oz) Gildan G180 Gildan G18000 Gildan G180 Gildan G180 Gildan G180

Adult Small - Adult XL 8.09 10.55 9.31 10.35 16.50

Adult 2XL 9.29 12.43 11.31 14.00 18.50

Adult 3XL 10.79 14.01 12.31 16.25 21.00

Adult 4XL 10.79 12.90 13.31 16.70 21.00

18 Sweatshirt - Crew Neck (12oz) FOL #82300 n/a FOL #82300 n/a FOL #C12M

Adult Small - Adult XL 15.93 discontinued 24.50

Adult 2XL 18.99 29.50

Adult 3XL 20.52 32.50

19 Sweatshirt - Crew Neck (12oz) Sport-Tek F280 n/a Sport-Tek F280 Sport-Tek F280 Sport-Tek F280

Adult Small - Adult XL 27.35 27.98 39.50 45.00

Adult 2XL 28.35 29.98 41.00 46.50

Adult 3XL 30.35 30.98 44.00 50.00

Adult 4XL 31.35 31.98 45.75 52.00

20
Men's & Ladies 1/4 Zip (100% 

poly)
Port Authority F218 Augusta 5507/5509 Team 365 TT31/TT31W Team 365 TT31/TT31W

Sport-Tek

ST357/LST357

Adult Small - Adult XL 19.16 30.95 11.41 13.50 14.50

Adult 2XL 20.16 31.24 13.41 15.00 16.00

Adult 3XL 21.16 34.26 14.41 16.75 20.00

Adult 4XL 22.16 34.26 15.41 18.25 21.50

21 Men's & Ladies Fleece 1/4 Zip Port Authority L218 n/a Port & Co. PC78Q Gildan 18810 Port & Co. PC78Q



CITY OF NOVI - SPORT CLOTHING APPAREL Bid due 3/25/26 2:00 p.m.

Item Description

Cole's

Screen Printing

Elohim Designs

and Creations Empire Printing Hilton Screeners
Impressive 

Professional Projects

Adult Small - Adult XL 19.16 14.63 17.00 20.00

Adult 2XL 20.16 16.63 20.45 21.00

Adult 3XL 21.16 17.63 24.00 23.00

22 Fleece Jacket, LS, M & W
Core365 

#88190/78190

Core365 

#88190/78190

Core365 

#88190/78190

Core365 

#88190/78190

Core365 

#88190/78190

Adult Small - Adult XL 23.02 21.00 22.18 28.65 30.50

Adult 2XL 25.08 23.00 24.18 31.00 34.00

Adult 3XL 26.11 24.00 25.18 32.50 36.00

Adult 4XL (Men's only) 27.14 25.00 26.18 34.00 37.50

Adult 5XL (Men's only) 28.17 26.00 27.18 35.65 39.50

23 T-shirts, LS, 100% cotton Gildan 5400/5400L Gildan 5400/5400L Gildan 5400/5400L Gildan 5400/5400L Gildan 5400/5400L

Adult Small - Adult XL 6.89 8.59 6.94 7.70 10.50

Adult 2XL 7.74 10.99 8.94 9.85 12.00

Adult 3XL 9.29 11.06 9.94 12.70 16.00

Adult 4XL 9.29 n/a 10.94 12.70 18.00

24 Wind Shirt, LS, unlined, V-neck Sport-Tek ST350LS n/a Sport-Tek JST72 Sport-Tek JST72 Sport-Tek JST72

Adult XSmall - Adult XL 7.16 18.61 22.35 27.50

Adult 2XL 8.16 20.61 23.95 29.00

Adult 3XL 9.16 21.61 26.95 32.50

Adult 4XL 10.16 22.61 28.50 34.50



CITY OF NOVI - SPORT CLOTHING APPAREL Bid due 3/25/26 2:00 p.m.

Item Description

Cole's

Screen Printing

Elohim Designs

and Creations Empire Printing Hilton Screeners
Impressive 

Professional Projects

25

Polo Shirt - SS, wicking, Mens & 

Ladies Harriton M315/M315W Harriton M315/M315W Harriton M315/M315W Harriton M315/M315W

Harriton M315/

M315W

Adult XSmall - Adult XL 17.90 16.20 16.77 21.40 23.50

Adult 2XL 19.96 18.60 18.77 24.50 27.00

Adult 3XL 20.99 19.80 19.77 25.65 29.00

Adult 4XL 22.02 21.00 20.77 27.75 30.50

26 Crew Neck Sweatshirt Jerzees 4662M n/a Jerzees 4662M Jerzees 4662M Jerzees 4662M

Adult XSmall - Adult XL 8.64 13.53 14.95 20.50

Adult 2XL 10.81 15.53 18.75 22.50

Adult 3XL 10.75 16.53 23.00 28.00

Adult 4XL 10.75 17.53 23.00 30.00

27 Hoodie Pullover Sweatshirt Hanes F170 Hanes F170 Hanes F170 Hanes F170 Hanes F170

Adult XSmall - Adult XL 23.70 21.88 18.59 28.95 32.00

Adult 2XL 27.79 26.56 20.59 35.00 38.50

Adult 3XL 31.67 31.08 21.59 41.00 45.50

28 Championship Prizes

https://www.promopla

ce.com/colesscreenpri

nting/

nothing submitted nothing submitted nothing submitted See bid

Delivery after receipt of order 10-14 days 15-20 business days 17 days 5 business days 15

Reprint delivery 7-10 days 5-10 business days 17 days 5 business days 10

How much time to ship 

Championship items to teams 14 days 15-20 business days n/a

Shirts 5 business days

Promo 15 business 

days 15 days

https://www.promoplace.com/colesscreenprinting/
https://www.promoplace.com/colesscreenprinting/
https://www.promoplace.com/colesscreenprinting/


CITY OF NOVI - SPORT CLOTHING APPAREL Bid due 3/25/26 2:00 p.m.

Item Description

Cole's

Screen Printing

Elohim Designs

and Creations Empire Printing Hilton Screeners
Impressive 

Professional Projects
C

o
m

m
e

n
ts

City of Novi will email 

desired products with 

details-size, color, qty, 

etc. Cole's will provide 

a proof and quote for 

approval. Once 

approved, production 

will start and delivery 

to the requested 

address.

Any style sized XXL or 

larger will incur an 

addtl. Cost

2XL +$2

3XL +$3

4XL +$4

Will allow employees 

to make personal 

purchases at the 

contract price



CITY OF NOVI - SPORT CLOTHING APPAREL Bid due 3/25/26 2:00 p.m.

Item Description

SETUP/ARTWORK

1 Logo Setup/Artwork Dept/City

2 Logo Setup/Artwork Sponsor

PRINTING COSTS (per shirt)

3 1 color logo/1 location

4 2 color logo/1 location

5 1 color logo/2 location

6 2 color logo/2 location

7 "Coach", "Supervisor", "Staff"

EMBROIDERY COSTS (per logo)

8 Embroidered logo - 1 color

9 Embroidered logo - 2 color

10

Embroidered logo - 1 color, on 

customer supplied item

11

Embroidered logo - 2 color, on 

customer supplied item

ADULT SOFTBALL/COACHSTAFF

12 T-Shirts, SS, 50/50 cotton/poly

 Youth Small - Youth XL

Adult Small - Adult XL

Adult 2XL

Adult 3XL

Adult 4XL

13 T-shirts, LS, 50/50 cotton/poly

Adult Small - Adult XL

Adult 2XL

Adult 3XL

Adult 4XL

14 T-shirt - SS, 100 % poly, wicking

Adult Small - Adult XL

Adult 2XL

Adult 3XL

JBC Threadworks Office Express

Riddell/

All American Seaside Companies SP Designs & Mfg

30.00

Silkscreen=$30 per color

Embroidery=$45 per color 25.00 per design 10.00 25.00

30.00

Silkscreen=$30 per color

Embroidery=$45 per color 25.00 per design 60.00 25.00

based on 97 pc min

0.90 5.75 2.60 3.50 0.45-0.90

1.50 7.50 2.70 3.75 0.90-1.80

1.30 11.25 5.20 3.75 0.90-1.80

2.80 15.00 5.40 4.00 1.80-3.60

0.50 5.75 2.60 10.00
depends on qty see 

bid

4.00 8.75 6.60 10.00 3.00-8.00

4.00 8.75 6.60 10.00 3.00-8.00

4.00 11.00 6.60 10.00 8.00

4.00 11.00 6.60 10.00 8.00

Gildan 8000 Port & Co. PC55 Gildan 8000 Gildan 8000 PC55/PC55Y

4.00 3.75 4.50 4.13 2.96

4.27 4.25 4.85 4.13 3.29

6.10 5.80 8.85 5.13 4.96

7.60 7.85 8.85 7.13 7.43

7.60 7.85 8.85 8.13 7.43

Port & Co PC55LS Port & Co PC55LS Gildan 8400 Gildan 8400 Port & Co PC55LS

8.20 7.70 8.35 7.60 5.90

9.10 8.45 10.30 9.60 7.10

10.20 9.49 10.30 10.60 8.92

10.20 9.49 n/a 11.60 8.92

Augusta 790 Augusta 790 Augusta 790 Augusta 790 Augusta 790

5.60 12.25 5.25 6.52 5.27

9.40 15.79 10.83 7.52 5.77

11.30 17.42 11.84 8.52 9.08



CITY OF NOVI - SPORT CLOTHING APPAREL Bid due 3/25/26 2:00 p.m.

Item Description

15 T-shirt - LS, 100% poly, wicking

Adult Small - Adult XL

Adult 2XL

Adult 3XL

16 Polo, SS 

Adult Small - Adult XL

Adult 2XL

Adult 3XL (no ladies)

Adult 4XL(no ladies)

17 Sweatshirt - Crew Neck (8oz)

Adult Small - Adult XL

Adult 2XL

Adult 3XL

Adult 4XL

18 Sweatshirt - Crew Neck (12oz)

Adult Small - Adult XL

Adult 2XL

Adult 3XL

19 Sweatshirt - Crew Neck (12oz)

Adult Small - Adult XL

Adult 2XL

Adult 3XL

Adult 4XL

20
Men's & Ladies 1/4 Zip (100% 

poly)

Adult Small - Adult XL

Adult 2XL

Adult 3XL

Adult 4XL

21 Men's & Ladies Fleece 1/4 Zip

JBC Threadworks Office Express

Riddell/

All American Seaside Companies SP Designs & Mfg

Augusta 788 Augusta 788 Augusta 788 Augusta 788 Augusta 788

8.50 16.69 7.97 11.47 8.19

8.50 18.60 10.25 13.57 8.69

12.20 21.36 11.30 16.60 12.00

Nike 

NKDC2103/1991

Nike 

NKDC2103/1992 Nike 373749/354064 Nike 373749/354064 Nike 373749/354064

29.50 30.15 no bid 32.01 22.08

30.50 31.30 no bid 36.01 23.35

32.50 33.77 no bid 37.35 25.89

33.50 35.15 no bid 37.35 27.16

Gildan G180 Gildan G180 Gildan 18000 Gildan G180 Gildan G180

13.65 11.65 10.95 9.45 9.47

14.65 13.15 14.20 14.79 11.92

16.20 15.15 14.20 16.20 13.93

16.20 15.15 14.20 17.45 13.93

Jerzees C12M Gildan 19000 FOL #82300 FOL #82300 Sport-Tek F280

19.50 17.75 no bid 29.28

22.50 20.48 no bid 30.28

23.90 23.45 no bid 32.28

Sport-Tek F280 Sport-Tek F280 Sport-Tek F280 Sport-Tek F280 Sport-Tek F280

32.80 27.95 27.30 29.80 29.28

33.80 29.20 28.85 35.13 30.28

35.80 31.69 32.05 36.47 32.28

36.80 32.95 33.65 37.80 33.28

Team 365 TT31/TT31W Team 365 TT31/TT31W Badger C2 #5102 Augusta 5507 EGPRO E213

11.70 16.88 11.69 33.20 9.45

12.70 18.13 16.33 33.51 10.45

13.70 19.38 16.33 36.75 11.45

14.70 20.63 16.33 37.14 12.45

Jerzees 995M Port & Co. PC78Q Jerzees 995M



CITY OF NOVI - SPORT CLOTHING APPAREL Bid due 3/25/26 2:00 p.m.

Item Description

Adult Small - Adult XL

Adult 2XL

Adult 3XL

22 Fleece Jacket, LS, M & W

Adult Small - Adult XL

Adult 2XL

Adult 3XL

Adult 4XL (Men's only)

Adult 5XL (Men's only)

23 T-shirts, LS, 100% cotton

Adult Small - Adult XL

Adult 2XL

Adult 3XL

Adult 4XL

24 Wind Shirt, LS, unlined, V-neck

Adult XSmall - Adult XL

Adult 2XL

Adult 3XL

Adult 4XL

JBC Threadworks Office Express

Riddell/

All American Seaside Companies SP Designs & Mfg

17.99 14.12 no bid 16.03

19.50 14.83 no bid 19.57

21.99 16.53 no bid 21.25

Core365 

#88190/78190
Core365 #88190/78190 Core365 #88190/78190

Core365 

#88190/78190

25.30 28.13 no bid 24.03 23.13

27.30 30.63 no bid 26.80 25.65

28.30 31.88 no bid 28.15 26.94

29.30 33.13 no bid 29.55 28.21

30.30 34.38 no bid 29.55 29.48

Gildan 5400/5400L Gildan 5400 Gildan 5400/5400L Gildan 5400/5400L Gildan 5400/5400L

7.99 7.37 8.25 5.80 6.49

8.99 8.75 10.51 11.13 9.13

10.99 11.33 10.50 12.47 11.76

10.99 n/a n/a 13.80 15.48

Sport-Tek JST72 Sport-Tek JST72 Sport-Tek JST72 Sport-Tek JST72 Sport-Tek JST72

19.35 18.15 20.98 18.15 19.34

20.35 19.40 25.19 19.40 20.61

22.35 21.90 25.19 21.90 23.15

23.35 23.15 25.19 23.15 24.42



CITY OF NOVI - SPORT CLOTHING APPAREL Bid due 3/25/26 2:00 p.m.

Item Description

25

Polo Shirt - SS, wicking, Mens & 

Ladies

Adult XSmall - Adult XL

Adult 2XL

Adult 3XL

Adult 4XL

26 Crew Neck Sweatshirt

Adult XSmall - Adult XL

Adult 2XL

Adult 3XL

Adult 4XL

27 Hoodie Pullover Sweatshirt

Adult XSmall - Adult XL

Adult 2XL

Adult 3XL

28 Championship Prizes

Delivery after receipt of order

Reprint delivery

How much time to ship 

Championship items to teams

JBC Threadworks Office Express

Riddell/

All American Seaside Companies SP Designs & Mfg

Harriton M315/

M315W

Harriton M315/

M315W

Harriton M315/

M315W

Harriton M315/

M315W

Harriton M315/

M315W

18.10 23.13 no bid 18.53 17.65

20.10 25.63 no bid 21.28 20.19

21.10 26.88 no bid 22.65 21.46

22.10 28.13 no bid 24.03 22.73

Jerzees 4662M Jerzees 4662M Jerzees 4662M Jerzees 4662M Jerzees 4662M

15.20 14.54 13.10 16.00 13.30

16.30 15.97 16.70 21.33 16.97

19.30 19.94 16.70 22.67 20.88

19.30 n/a 16.70 24.00 23.32

Hanes F170 Hanes F170 Hanes F170 Hanes F170 Hanes F170

25.40 29.18 24.10 24.93 24.19

29.40 33.92 28.63 30.39 29.01

33.40 38.63 28.63 35.56 33.79

nothing submitted see bid nothing submitted nothing submitted nothing submitted

14-16 days 14 business days 30-60

7 days for bland garments

30 days for custom 14

10 days 14 business days contact sales rep 30 days 10

within 14-16 days

Varies by item & 

manufacturer. Proposed 

ones vary from 9 to 28 

business days. 30 days 30 days

10-30 days depending 

on product



CITY OF NOVI - SPORT CLOTHING APPAREL Bid due 3/25/26 2:00 p.m.

Item Description
C

o
m

m
e

n
ts

JBC Threadworks Office Express

Riddell/

All American Seaside Companies SP Designs & Mfg

23. 4XL = Port&Co 

PC61LS

26. 4XL = Port&Co 

PC90

PMS color match fee is #30 

per imprint order. This 

applies to each order and 

is in addition to the 

silkscreen costs shown on 

first page. Silkscreen orders 

require a minimum of 6 

shirts. PMS match is not 

available for embroidery.


