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City ofF Novi City COUNCIL
JUNE 5, 2023

SUBJECT: Approval to award contract for Police and Fire Department uniforms to Allie
Brothers, Inc., the lowest unit price bidder on a maijority of the items, effective
July 1, 2023 for an estimated annual amount of $90,000 for a period of two (2)
years, with three (3) renewal options in one (1) year increments. Contfract also
includes Police uniform upgrade during FY 2023-24 for a budgeted amount of

$90,000.

SUBMITTING DEPARTMENT: Public Safety

EXPENDITURE REQUIRED

$30,000 Fire

$60,000 Police

$90,000 Police - uniform upgrade
$180,000

AMOUNT BUDGETED

$90,000 Fire
$90,000 Police
$90,000 Police - uniform upgrade

$270,000* (FY 2023-24 Budget)

*Budget includes turn-out gear, ballistics vests,
cleaning, etc. excluded from this contract

APPROPRIATION REQUIRED

N/A

LINE ITEM NUMBER

101-336.00-741.000 Fire
101-301.00-741.000 Police
101-301.00-741.010 Police - uniform upgrade

BACKGROUND INFORMATION:

Bid Documents for the annual Polce and Fire Department uniforms and Police
Department uniform upgrade (FY 2023-24) were posted on the Michigan




Intergovernmental Trade Network (MITN) website on May 9, 2023. We received four
(4) bids with unit pricing. Allie Brothers had the lowest unit pricing on the maijority of
items.

This contract provides all uniforms required by the Police and Fire Departments.
Police and Fire officers are provided a full uniform at hiring. Thereafter, replacements
are ordered based upon yearly summer and winter uniform inspections. Contract
also includes the Police Department uniform upgrade project for FY 2023-2024.

This is a two (2) year contract with three (3) renewal options in one (1) year
increments.

RECOMMENDED ACTION: Approval to award contract for Police and Fire Department
uniforms to Allie Brothers, Inc., the lowest unit price bidder on a maijority of the item:s,
effective July 1, 2023 for an estimated annual amount of $20,000 for a period of two
(2) years, with three (3) renewal options in one (1) year increments. Contract also
includes Police uniform upgrade during FY 2023-24 for a budgeted amount of
$90,000.



CITY OF NOoVI MAY 25, 2023
UNIFORMS BID - POLICE DEPARTMENT
P O LICE Brand / Model # Additional Description Allie Brothers |Nye Uniform Co.| _Jonah's iesorEolice
Enterprises Supply
Shirts
100% Polyester Ripstop 6.60z
Blauer FLEXRS w/mechanical stretch. Mesh side panels
. ) Armorskin Base 92% nylon, 8% spandex. Satin 100% .
Long Sleeve - Winter | - o\t 48361 (Mens) Polyester mesh lining (Navy); royal blue 80:99 6350 B Naisio
#8361W (Womens) and white on black hash bars on left sleeve
coordinated with years of service.
Blauer FLEXRS 100% Polyester Ripstop 6.60z
. Armorskin Base w/mechanical stretch. Mesh side panels .
Short Sleeve - Summer | gy #8362 (Mens) 92% nylon, 8% spandex. Satin 100% SRR 59.99 102238 ofeid
#8362W (Womens) Polyester mesh lining (Navy)
Blauer Polyester 100% Polyester Tropic Weight Side Mesh
* Long Sleeve - Winter Supershirt 92% Nylon, 8% Lycra (White); royal blue .
Command #8670 (Mens) and white on black hash bars on left sleeve 58.99 698 1811 hisiBid
#8670W (Womens) coordinated with years of service.
Blauer Polyester
* Short Sleeve - Winter Supershirt 100% Polyester Tropic Weight Side Mesh .
Command #8675 (Mens) 92% Nylon, 8% Lycra (White) el 64.99 11023 No Bid
#8675W (Womens)
* Fatigue Shirt Elbeco #9204 Navy Long sleeve Base Layer 39.99 54.99 15.29 No Bid
Flying Cross Pro Fit . . )
Mock Turtleneck Split Mock Neck | 2ctical Mock turtle neck compression fit in 45.00 54.99 61.19 No Bid
Dark Navy
#57010
- Flying Cross Mock . . .
Mock Dickie Dickey #52100 Flying Cross Mock Dickey #52100 14.99 16.99 12.59 No Bid
“K-9 Shirt Elbeco #9204 Navy, Additional patch to be embroidered on 39.99 60.99 64.17 No Bid
left chest, no badge tab
Pants
Blauer FLEXRS
S Covert Tactical Pant 100% Polyester Ripstop 6.60z ]
Midweight Pant #8666 (Mens) wimechanical stretch 78.99 81.99 105.29 No Bid
#8666W (Womens)
Blauer Flexheat
Winterweight Pant Detail Pant 90% Polyester, 10% Spandex w/bonded fleece 107.99 109.99 140.39 No Bid
#8833
Fatigue Pant Elbeco #E7604 Navy 39.99 54.99 111.96 No Bid
K-9 Pant Elbeco #E7604 Navy 39.99 54.99 111.96 No Bid
Gun Pocket To be added to pants as requested n/a 15.00 63.00 No Bid
Necktles
Clip on Regular Length Navy, 75% Polyester / 25% Wool 6.50 5.99 2.93 No Bid
Clip on Long Length Navy, 75% Polyester / 25% Wool 7.50 5.99 3.51 No Bid
Hand Tied Navy, 75% Polyester / 25% Wool 6.50 5.99 15.29 No Bid
Headgear
Uniform Hat - Dress Keystone Uniform Cap Model 278 Navy 64.99 64.99 58.49 No Bid
Command Uniform Hat - Model 278 Navy, Center Post Hole with gold
D Keystone Uniform Cap | "scrambled egg" on bill for Commanders, Asst 84,99 79.99 58.49 No Bid
ress . .
Chief and Chief
Hat Cover Blauer #107 Reversible urethane coated nylon, (Yellow) 11.99 14.99 13.49 No Bid
} Blaur FLEXRS Navy, w/ Embroidered Novi PD patch sewn on; R
Baseball Cap Fitted Fitted Cap #197 Fitted Hat 19.99 16.99 16.19 No Bid
Blaur FLEXRS ) . .
Baseball Cap Adjustable | Airvent Adjustable | Navy W/ Embroidered Novi PD patch sewn on: 19.99 16.99 16.19 No Bid
Adjustable Hat
#198
Knit Watch Cap Blauer Skull Cap #160 | Black, w/ Embroidered Novi PD patch sewn on 29.99 26.99 25.19 No Bid
Outerwear
Epaulets, mic tab & badge tab, Shell: 100%
Nylon with B.DRY waterproof breathable
* All Weather Jacket Blauer TacShell #9820 | membrane, Lining: 100% Tricot. Navy, w/Novi 259.99 274,99 464.61 No Bid
patch on both sleeves. Designed for layering
warmth with softshell jacket.
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CITY OF NOVI

UNIFORMS BID - POLICE DEPARTMENT

MAY 25, 2023

POLICE

Brand / Model #

Additional Description

Allie Brothers

Nye Uniform Co.

Jonah's

Kiesler Police

Enterprises Supply
Mic Tab & Badge Tab, Shell: 88% Nylon/12%
Blauer Softshell Fleece : 5 o
Softshell Fleece Jacket #4660 or spandex, Interior 50% Polyester, 44% Nylon, 129.99 139.99 236.23 No Bid
1/4 Zip Fleece #4605 i SPERHENiSeEs
Navy, w/Novi patch on both sleeves.
511 Brand: ID Jacket: | wi/concealable "Police" banner on back and .
FTO Jacket 48016 chest 49.99 74.99 82.80 No Bid
. Blauer Defender All Yellow, full length, w/ scotchlight reflective .
Raincoat #26990 striping 125.00 149.99 251.98 No Bid
0,
* Sweater Blauer Commando 100% Wool, Badge tabs and name tab sewn na 5499 107.10 No Bid
#200 on
Footwear
Shoes 8346027 Weinbrenner Low-quarter, leather, rubber sole Discontinued 74.99 180.00 No Bid
Galoshes w/ center front zipper Discontinued 0.00 180.00 No Bid
Motorcycle
* Shirt Olympic Coolmax Navy, Short Sleeve 49.99 54.99 74.69 No Bid
. Fleichheimer Flying
Riding 3&22‘:::? -Cool | Cross LAPD Specs Navy 69.99 349.99 430.19 No Bid
#RN28562
Riding Breeches - Warm . ; o " T .
Weather United Uniform Navy, 100% Polyester, Police Riding Pant 69.99 189.99 170,78 No Bid
. Black, Leather w/epaulets, badge holder, )
Leather Jacket Taylor removable liner, Detroit style 359.99 409.99 373.50 No Bid
Black, Leather, 9 hole lace at Instep, single .
Cycle Boots Dehners #34926 B 289.99 0.00 1,355.00 No Bid
Rain Jacket Dry Rider #475MD w/Scotchlight reflective stripe 39.99 56.99 476.96 No Bid
Rain Pants Dry Rider #475 w/Scotchlight reflective stripe 39.99 50.99 809.96 No Bid
Gloves Olympia - Roper | 29.99 0.00 42.30 No Bid
Goggles Wiley X "Raptor" 95.00 0.00 93.41 No Bid
Bike Uniform
Royal / Navy Scotchlite stripe on Sleeve and
chest, 3 1/4" X 9 1/4" Scotchlite "POLICE" on
Shirt Blauer #8133P back, Badge patch on left chest Zippered 59.99 84.99 118.11 No Bid
pocket w/pen holders, police patches on both
sleeves
Turtleneck Under Armour Tactical Mock turtle neck, compression fit, 45.00 44.99 49.50 No Bid
Dark Navy
Shorts Blauer #8842 Navy 69.99 81.99 97.19 No Bid
Sweatpants Blauer #88227 Navy 89.99 104.99 124.19 No Bid
Royal / Navy, Scotchlite stripe on Sleeve and
chest, 3 1/4" X 9 1/4" Scotchlite "POLICE" on
Jacket Blauer #4660P back, Badge patch on left chest Zippered 119.99 164.99 236.23 No Bid
pocket w/pen holders, police patches on both
sleeves
New Balance Bike ) ) .
Shoes Shoes #706 Black Discontinued 0.00 112.49 No Bid
Bike Garrison Belt Safariland 4325 23.99 51,99 25.43 No Bid
Bike Sam Brown Belt Safariland 4300 34.99 24.99 101.25 No Bid
. ] 6280 Nylon for Glock 17 that can .
Bike Gun Holster Safariland accommodate attached flashiight. 109.99 134.99 198.45 No Bid
Bike Handcuff Case Safariland 4250 16.99 29.99 41.85 No Bid
Bike Magazine Case Safariland 4110 29.99 37.99 46.80 No Bid
Bike Flashlight Case Safariland 4230 17.99 29.99 40.05 No Bid
Bike Belt Keepers Safariland 4200 14.99/set 16.99 17.78 No Bid
Bike Gloves Hatch CTM 100 29.99 0.00 31.50 No Bid
Glasses Wiley X Romer Il 84.99 0.00 139.50 No Bid
SRT Uniforms/Equipment
Sure Fire SureFire X300 Weapons mounted light 264.99 299.94 323.10 262.00
Blackhawk Omega 62.00
Holster Drop Holster 7450 5409 8231 40ALH1BK

Page 2 of 4




CITY OF NOVI

UNIFORMS BID - POLICE DEPARTMENT

MAY 25, 2023

POLICE

Brand / Model #

Additional Description

Allie Brothers

Nye Uniform Co.

Jonah's

Kiesler Police

Enterprises Supply
Boots NB Boots 811BK New Balance Black Discontinued 0.00 90.00 No Bid
Leather Gear
Bianchi Acumold Duty
Garrison Belt belt with tri-release Basket Weave 2.25" Duty Belt 59.99 61.99 67.50 No Bid
Buckle #7950
Liner Belt for Acumold Duty | Bianchi Liner Belt 2 1/4', fully lined, basket weave 28.99 24.99 33.75 No Bid
Belt #7205
Off Duty Weapon Holster |  Blackhawk CQC For Glock 17; pricing for belt mounting and 59.99 49.99 47.66 37.00
paddle mounting
Cuff Case ASP Exo Case #56130| Lightweight, Rapid Deployment, Snap-loc 45.00 42.99 41.40 35.00
Chemical Spray Carrier Boston Lea;her#5535- Basket weave for Freeze +P spray 24.99 24.99 25.70 No Bid
Flashlight Holder | 20St1 "ea;he' #5491-| Basket weave for Streamlight Stinger LED HL 29.99 26.99 2879 No Bid
Magazine Carrier Safariland #77-83-4 | Basketweave, double with snaps; gold for 39.99 39.99 46.80 No Bid
command, silver for officers and sergeants
Belt Keepers Boston Leather Basket weave 2.99 4.99 7.30 No Bid
Beit Badge Holder Boston Leather Die-Cut for badge B-251 19.99 23.99 11.69 No Bid
Neck Badge Holder Perfect Fit #706 With Chain 19.99 15.99 22.50 No Bid
Badge Case Strong #B251 Leather 24,99 18.99 50.36 No Bid
Magazine / Cuff Holder Safariland #2601 Basket weave 45.00 45,99 56.25 No Bid
Equipment
ASP Ultra Plus #56061 68.00-chain 61.00-chain
Handcuffs (chain) #56070 (hinge) Ultra Plus 78.00-hinge 72.99 P 70.00-hinge
Riot Helmet P'e;“é‘fg(%gwn With Shield and Neck Protector FXR 169.00 0.00 152.99 No Bid
Flashlight Streamlight #75455 Stinger DS LED Flashlight 159.99 160.99 197.90 132.00
Traffic Vest Blauer 343P ANSI107-2015 Type P Class 2, Zip Front 59.99 64.99 81.89 No Bid
Break Away
Clipboard Saunders #10003 8 3/4" x 14" Aluminum 24.99 24.99 25.46 No Bid
Ticket Book Holder Saunders #12205 5" x 12" Aluminum 32.99 34.99 40.18 No Bid
Binoculars Bushnell 10x50 Insta-Focus 60.00 84.99 58.49 No Bid
Range Glasses Silencio Clear Lens 8.99 0.00 4.83 No Bid
Gloves Hatch RFK300 Cut Resistant glove 39.99 37.99 37.76 No Bid
Accessories / Brass
. . Silver - Officers / Sergeants .
Shirt Badge Blackinton B251 Gold - Command 69.99 84.99 94,05 No Bid
. Silver - Officers / Sergeants A
Jacket Badge Blackinton B562 Gold - Command 69.99 84,99 144 45 No Bid
, Silver - Officers / Sergeants .
Hat Badge Blackinton B616 Gold - Command 64.99 73.99 69.75 No Bid
. Silver - Officers / Sergeants .
Wallet Badge Blackinton B251 Flat Gold - Command 64.99 84.99 102,15 No Bid
Silver - Officers / Sergeants
Name Plate Blackinton A2388 Gold - Command Black Letters, Pin & Clasp 14,99 19.99 22.86 No Bid
Back
Silver - Officers / Sergeants
Tie Bar Blackinton Gold - Command State Seal w/ "Novi Police" 17.99 25.99 30.69 No Bid
engraved
Collar VI Blackinton Silver - Custom made "VI" 8.99/piece 25.99 22,77 No Bid
Collar Rank Insignia - . . .
Sergeant Blackinton Chevron. 3 Stripes 9.50 20.99 22.77 No Bid
Collar Rank Insignia - . . .
Lieutenant Blackinton A1973 Gold bar, Flat finish 15.99 18.99 20.52 No Bid
Collar Ra"‘EL"iZ'fg”'a ASSL L Blackinton A3731 3 Gold Stars 24.99 43.99 25.65 No Bid
Collar Rank Insignia - Chief|  Blackinton A3731 4 Gold Stars 29.99 47.99 27.63 No Bid

Page 3 of 4




CITY OF NOVI

UNIFORMS BID - POLICE DEPARTMENT

MAY 25, 2023

POLICE

Brand / Model #

Additional Description

Allie Brothers

Nye Uniform Co.

Jonah's

Kiesler Police

Enterprises Supply
Coat Epaulet Rank Insignia | - inion a1973 Gold bar, Flat finish 15.99 18.99 20.52 No Bid
Lieutenant
Coat Epaulet Rank Insignia { = g, inion A3731 3 Gold Stars 24.99 43.99 20.52 No Bid
Asst. Chief
Coat Epa”'gh'?;”k Insignia | p1- cinton A3731 4 Gold Stars 29.99 47.99 25.65 No Bid
. Silver - Officers / Sergeants .
Whistle Acme Thunderer Gold - Command W/Tooth Protector 6.00 6.99 17.09 No Bid
Whistle Chain Blackinton V313 Siivery OfiearsVSSrgegiiE 3.99 25.99 29.52 No Bid
Gold - Command
Hat Bands Blackinton V298 Black=icers. SiVer= Sergegnis 12.00 20.99 24.93 No Bid
Gold - Command
Streamlight min
order is 4.
Comments n/a n/a n/a Surefire min
order is 2.
See Attachment
e 'Addendum to
larifi Sl /
Clarification n/a Bid Police n/a n/a
Uniforms'
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CITY OF NOVI

UNIFORMS BID - FIRE DEPARTMENT

MAY 25, 2023

F I RE Brand/Model # Additonal description Allie Brothers | Nye Uniform Co. E::; '::::es Kiessls:,;zhce
SHIRTS/JACKETS
** |_ong Sleeve Shirt (Navy) Elbeco G974 65% poly/35% cotton with Nano Tex 47.99 51.99 68.40 No Bid
** Short Sleeve Shirt (Navy) Elbeco G964 65% poly/35% cotton with Nano Tex 44.99 46.99 61.92 No Bid
Polo Shirt 5.11 Name embroidered in white on right chest, .
(Navy or Grey) 51171049 small patch sewn on left chest 53.99 45.99 43.20 No Bid
Dark blue wireflective 'Novi Fire/Rescue' in
. 5 scotch-lite on back. Name embroidered in .
Jacket HI Vis (Navy) 5.11 48073 white on right chest with Velcro tab small 305.00 289.99 404.99 No Bid
patch sewn on left chest
** Long Sleeve Shirt (White) Elbeco 310 100% poly TexTrop 41.99 49.99 76.55 No Bid
** Short Sleeve Shirt (White) Elbeco 3310 100% poly TexTrop 39.99 44 .99 65.70 No Bid
Job Shirt (Navy) Flex Tech Name embroidered in white on right chest, .
Quarter Zip Elbeco T3774 small patch sewn on left chest 74.99 59.99 69.66 No Bid
* Dress Blousecoat (Navy) Class A double-breasted, 55%
. ¢/ Elbeco #13750 poly/45% wool NFD patches on 229.99 204.99 264.78 No Bid
Dress Uniform .
sleeves. Includes striping & stars
Fruit of the Loom 100% cotton, with silkscreened logo
T-Shirt as specified by Fire Dept. (Minimum of 12.00 12.99 3.56 No Bid
Heavy .
12 to be ordered at one time)
57% Polyester/28% Wool/15%Acrylic
** Sweater Fleece Lined V-Neck Blauer #225 with 100% Polyester Fleece backing 114.99 119.99 112.49 No Bid
fabric with name and badge tab.
PANTS
Uniform Pants (Navy) Elbeco E814 65% poly/35% cotton with Nano Tex 47.99 46.99 89.99 No Bid
Cargo Pants (Navy) Eibaco E614 65% poly/35% cotton with TekTwill 69.99 66.99 49.50 No Bid
Dress Trouser (Navy) Elbeco E1360 Class A, 55% polyester/45% wool 79.99 94,99 106.11 No Bid
with Scotchlite on sleeves and ankles
**Coveralls (Navy) Red Cap #CT10NV | and down the front, silkscreened logo 29.99 89.99 4527 No Bid
as specified by Fire Dept.
HATS
. ) Serge: black band for firefighters, silver for .
Fire Cap (Navy) Hankin Bros #5-1-1 Lieutenants, Gold Captain and above 61.99 139.99 58.49 No Bid
) wool, with embroidered logo as .
Ball Cap (Navy) Broder Flexfit #6477 specified by Fire Dept. 12.99 20.99 9.79 No Bid
Watch Cap (Black) Broner Super Stretch il embrOIdell':eirdelngec;tas SReciiedloy 7.99 7.99 5.92 No Bid
MISCELLANEOUS
. . Silver w one horn for Lieutenants, .
Hat Badge (Nickel) Blackinton # B500 Gold for Captains two horns, 34.99 49.99 164.70 No Bid
Uniform Tie (Black) Samuel Broome Wool, clip-on 6.99 5.99 9.89 No Bid
B/W Fire Belt (Black) Tex Shoemaker 32.99 35.99 62.09 No Bid
A Silver with State seal for firefighters and
pn|form Badge Blackinton #B1009 Lieutenants Gold with State seal for 65.99 69.99 121.50 No Bid
(Silver and/or Gold) c .
aptains and Above,
Uniform Collar Insignia (Gold) #A6981 Captain All gold; round with 2 horns 13.99 18.99 11.66 No Bid
Uniform Collar Insignia (Silver ) #A6985 Lieutenant All silver, round with 1 horn 13.99 18.99 7.65 No Bid
Tie Bars (Silver) Blackinton State of Michigan Seal with "Novi Fire 16.99 25.99 30.69 No Bid
engraved
Tie Bars (Gold) Blackinton State of Michigan Seal with "Novi Fire 16.99 25.99 30,69 No Bid
engraved
Silver - Firefighters / Lieutenants
Name Tags Blackinton A2388 Gold - Captains and Administration 14.50 19.99 22.86 No Bid
Black Letters, Pin & Clasp Back

Page 1 of 2



CITY OF NOvI
UNIFORMS BID - FIRE DEPARTMENT

MAY 25, 2023

F | RE Brand/Model # Additonal description Allie Brothers | Nye Uniform Co. E:t:::::es Kiesél:;:;"ce
OVERSIZE
Work Pant (Navy) sizes 48 & up n/a 10% 26.99 No Bid
**Short Sleeve Shirt XXL n/a 10% 61.92 No Bid
**Short Sleeve Shirt XXXL n/a 10% 61.92 No Bid
**L ong Sleeve Shirt XXL n/a 10% 112.49 No Bid
**Long Sleeve Shirt XXXL n/a 10% 112.49 No Bid
T-Shirt XXL n/a 10% 5.93 No Bid
T-Shirt XXXL n/a 10% 7.63 No Bid
**Coveralls 50/52 n/a 10% 47.20 No Bid
**Coveralls 54/56 n/a 10% 47.20 No Bid
**Coveralls 58/60 n/a 10% 47.20 No Bid
**Jacket Size 50 - 52 n/a 10% 236.23 No Bid
**Jacket Size 54 & up n/a 10% 236.23 No Bid
ALTERATIONS
(oversize only)

Pants n/a 10% 4.50 No Bid
Shirts n/a 10% 3.50 No Bid
Jacket n/a 10% 5.50 No Bid
Coverall n/a 10% 6.50 No Bid

Comments n/a n/a n/a n/a

See Attachment
Clarification n/a Addgnd_tlm . n/a n/a
Bid Fire
Uniforms'
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r NOTICE - CITY OF NOVI

INVITATION TO BID

UNIFORMS - POLICE AND FIRE
NOVE

cityofnovi.org
This bid is issued by the Purchasing Office of the City of Novi.

IMPORTANT DATES

Bid Issue Date May 9, 2023

Last Date for Questions  Thursday, May 18, 2023 by 12:00 P.M. EDT
Please submit all questions via email to:
Tracey Marzonie, Purchasing Accountant
tmarzonie@cityofnovi.org

Response Due Date Thursday, May 25, 2023 by 2:00 P.M. EDT

Bids may be submitted via hard copy OR uploaded to
the MITN website at www.mitn.info.

If submitting hard copies, deliver to:
City of Novi
Finance Department
45175 Ten Mile Road
Novi, Ml 48375

DESCRIPTION:
This contract is for the purchase of Police Department uniforms and Fire Department
uniforms,

NOTICE TO BIDDERS

The City of Novi officially distributes bid documents through the Michigan Intergovernmental Trade
Network (MITN], Coples of bld documents obtained from any other source are not considered
official coples. The City of Novi cannot guarantee the accuracy of any information not obtained
from the MITN welbsite and is not responsible for any emors contained by any information received
from altemnate sources. Only those vendors who obtain bid documents from the MITN system are
guaranteed access to receive addendum information, if such information is issued. If you
obtained this document from a source other than the source indicated, it is recommended that
you register on the MITN site, www.mitn.info and obtain an official copy.
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NOVE

cityofnovi.org

CITY OF NOVI
UNIFORMS - POLICE AND FIRE

SPECIFICATIONS

SCOPE OF WORK

The City of Novi is seeking sealed bids to provide Police and Fire Department uniforms.
It is the City's intent fo make an award to one vendor who will provide all of the items
included on the bid forms.

TYPE OF CONTRACT

The initial contract period will be for two (2) years. Upon mutual consent of the City of
Novi and the successful bidder, the contract may be renewed three (3) times in one (1)
year increments,

ESTIMATED QUANTITIES
Police Department currently has 73 swomn staff members who are supplied with

uniforms. Fire Department has 80 staff members who are supplied with uniforms. These
numbers may change during contract period.

New recruits are issued a set of uniform items and accessories according to their union
contract. In the spring and fall of each year, each depariment places an order for
uniform items needing replacement due to wear, damage, or fit problems. During the
2023-24 fiscal year the Police Department will transition to a new uniform for all sworn
personnel. There may be additional smaller orders throughout the year.

MEASURING

Measuring for all uniforms will be provided on-site at the Novi Police Department (45125
Ten Mile Road, Novi MI 48375) and the Novi Fire Department Station #1 (42975 Grand
River Ave., Novi MI). Vendor may be required to bring samples for sizing to the
measurement appointment. These appointments will be arranged by the departments,

TAILORING

Tailoring will be provided to ensure that the garments fit each employee properly. All
additional alteration and fitting costs will be borne by the bidder, except for oversize
items for Fire Department as shown on the bid form.  Bidder will make every effort to
satisfy the reasonable desires of each employee. Should a disagreement arise
between the bidder and an employee, the bidder agrees to settle the dispute in a
manner which satisfies the City of Novi designated employees. Successful bidder will
be responsible for pick-up and delivery of the items from the depariment if the problem
is deemed to be the quality of tailoring.

DELIVERY
Uniforms will be delivered to the appropriate Department. Each item will be packaged
and clearly marked with the employee to whom it belongs.
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Delivery of uniform items is expected within 14 working days. The successful bidder must
immediately notify the appropriate department if exitraordinary circumstances cause
extended delivery time. Failure by the supplier to deliver within the stated time may
result in termination of the contract.

FREIGHT/ DELIVERY CHARGES

All delivery and/or freight charges are to be included in the unit pricing of the bid item:s.
All bid pricing is to be quoted as F.O. B. delivered.

INSURANCE

A cerfificate of insurance naming the City of Novi as an additional insured must be
provided by the successful bidder prior to commencement of work., A cument certificate
of insurance meeting the requirements in Attachment A is to be provided to the City and
remain in force during the entire contract period.

TAX EXEMPTION

It is understood that the City of Novi is a governmental unit, and as such, is exempt from
the payment of all Michigan State Sales and Federal Excise taxes. Do nof include such
taxes in the bid prices. The City will furnish the successful bidder with a tax exemption
certificate when requested. The City's tax-exempt number is 38-6032551.

INVOICING/PAYMENT TERMS

Invoices will be sent to the Finance Department after uniforms have been delivered.
The invoice will be processed and every effort will be made to make payment within 30
days. Problems with an order or an incorrect invoice may cause a delayed payment.

Invoices may be mailed to: City of Novi, Attn: Finance Department, 45175 Ten Mile
Road, Novi, Ml 48375 or emailed to: invoices@cityofnovi.ora. This email is to be used for
invoices and statements only and not for any other type of communication or sales.

We are unable to respond to any inquiries from this email.

REFERENCES

Please include a list of references from 3 municipadlities (not including the City of Novi)
for which you have provided this service within the last 3 years. Include entity name,
address, contact name, and contact phone number.

Page 8 of 18



1LY OF

CITY OF NOVI
BID FORM - POLICE DEPARTMENT UNIFORMS

We the undersigned as bidder, propose to furnish to the City of Novi, according to the

cityafnovi.org conditions and instructions attached hereto and made a part thereof for the following
prices:
* Price to include badge tab and supplier to sew on two (2) Police Department furnished shoulder patches.
Brand / Style# Additional Description Unit Price
Shirts
100% Polyester Ripstop 6.60z $60.99
Blauer FLEXRS w/mechanical stretch. Mesh side panels ’
. LW Armorskin Base 92% nylon, 8% Spandex. Satin 100%
Long Sleeve - Winter | gyt #8361 (Mens) |  Polyester mesh lining (Navy); royal blue
#8361W (Womans) | and white on black hash bars on left sleeve
coordinated with years of service.
Blauer FLEXRS 100% Polyester Ripstop 6.60z
* } Armorskin Base w/mechanical stretch. Mesh side panels $54.99
Short Sleeve - Summer | gy 43369 (Mens) | 92% nylon, 8% Spandex. Satin 100%
#8362W (Womans) Polyester mesh lining (Navy)
Blauer Polyester 100 % Polyester Tropic Weight Side Mesh $58.99
* Long Sleeve - Winter Supershirt 92% Nylon, 8% Lycra (White); royal blue
Command #8670 (Mens) and white on black hash bars on left sleeve
#8670W (Womans) coordinated with years of service.
Bluer Polyester $56.99
* Short Sleeve - Winter Supershirt 100% Polyester Tropic Weight Side Mesh :
Command #8675 (Mens) 92% Nylon, 8% Lycra (White)
#8675W (Womans)
* Fatigue Shirt Elbeco #9204 Navy Long sleeve Base Layer $39.99
Flying Cross Pro Fit . D e
Mock Turtleneck Split Mock Neck Tactical Mock tugle E(—:r-\j::vcompressmn fitin $45.00
#57010 ark Navy
I Flying Cross Mock . . $14.99
Mock Dickie Dickey #52100 Flying Cross Mock Dickey #52100
1 . Navy, Additional patch to be embroidered $39.99
KOSl Elbecooety on left chest, no badge tab
Pants
Blauer FLEXRS
) $78.99
Covert Tactical .
Midweight Pant Pant B e 602
#8666 (Mens) mechanical stretch.
#8666W (Womans)
Blauer Flexheat 107.99
Winterweight Pant Detail Pant 90% Polyester, 10;/0 Spandext w/ bonded $
#8833 e
Fatigue Pant Elbeco #E7604 Navy $39.99
K-9 Pant Elbeco #E7604 Navy $39.99
Gun Pocket To be added to pants as requested N/A
Neckties
Clip on Regular Length Navy, 75% Polyester / 25% Wool $6.50
Clipon Long Length Navy, 75% Polyester / 25% Wool $7.50
Hand Tied Navy, 75% Polyester / 25% Wool b
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Headgear

A $64.99
Uniform Hat - Dress Keystor&ZFl)Jmform Model 278 Navy
Command Uniform Hat- | Keystone Uniform MBdeliSs NatyaCenisfizest i_-lofle with $84.99
Dress Cap gold "scrambled egg” on bill or
Commanders, Asst Chief, and Chief
Hat Cover Blauer #107 Reversible urethane coated nylon, (Yellow) $11.99
. Blauer FLEXRS Navy, w/ Embroidered Novi PD patch sewn $19.99
pasetal Cepiited Fitted Cap #197 on: Fitted Hat
Blauer FLEXRS . . $19.99
Baseball Cap Adjustable Airvent Adjustable N2, ol Embr?fe!' ed r\:)cIJw: ¢ [PatchisSin
#198 on: Adjustable Hat
Knit Watch Cap Blauer Skull Cap Black, w/ Embroidered Novi PD patch sewn $29.99
#160 on
Outerwear
Epaulets, mic tab & badge tab, Shell: 100%
Nylon with B.DRY® waterproof breathable $259.99
All Weather Jacket Blau;rggggShell membrane, Lining: 100% Tricot. Navy,
w/Novi patch on both sleeves. Designed for
layering warmth with softshell jacket
i 0,
Elatierseishel il S e $129.99
Softshell Fleece Jacket | Fleece #4660 or % Y ey
Zio Fleece #4605 Polyester, 44% Nylon, 6% Spandex fleece.
P Navy, w/Novi patch on both sleeves.
511 Brand: ID wlconcealable "Police” banner on back and $49.99
T acke Jacket: 48016 chest
Raincoat Blauer Defender All Yellow, full tength, w/ scotchlight $125.00
#26990 reflective striping
* Sweater Blauer Commando 100% Wool, Badge tabs and name tab N/A
#200 sewn on
'Footwear .
8346027 Discontinued
Shoes Weinbrenner Low-quarter, leather, rubber sole
Galoshes w/ center front zipper Discontinued
Motorcycle
* Shirt Olympic Coolmax Navy, Short Sleeve $49.99
.- . Fleichheimer Flying
Riding 3&:2?: :rs S Cross LAPD Specs Navy $69.99
#RN28562
Riding Bﬁ::{;::r - B United Uniform Navy, 100% Polyester, Police Riding Pant $69.99
* Leather Jacket Taylor Black, Leather w/gpaulets, b?dge holder, $359.99
removable liner, Detroit style
Cycle Boots Dehners #3496 | Black, Leather, 9 hole lace at Instep, single $289.99
buckle calf, rubber sole
Rain Jacket Dry Rider #475MD w/Scotchlight reflective stripe $39.99
Rain Pants Dry Rider #475 w/Scotchlight reflective stripe $39.99
Gloves Olympia - Roper | $29.99
Goggles Wiley X "Raptor” $95.00
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-Bike Uniform

Royal / Navy Scotchlite stripe on Sleeve

and chest, 3 1/4" X 8 1/4" Scotchlite $59.99
Shirt Blauer #8133P "POLICE" on back, Badge patch on left
chest Zippered pocket w/pen holders, police
patches on both sleeves
Tirtieneck Under Armour Tactical Mock turtle neck, compression fit, $45.00
Dark Navy
Shorts Blauer #8842 Navy $69.99
Sweatpants Blauer #8822Z Navy $89.99
Royal / Navy, Scotchlite stripe on Sleeve $119.99
and chest, 3 1/4" X 9 1/4" Scotchlite
Jacket Blauer #4660P "POLICE" on back, Badge patch on left
chest Zippered pocket w/pen holders, police
patches on bath sleeves
New Balance Bike
Sheos Shoes #706 Black Discontinued
Bike Garrison Belt Safariland 4325 $23.99
Bike Sam Brown Belt Safariland 4300 $34.99
; ; 6280 Nylon for Glock 17 that can 109.99
Bike Gun Holster Faleriand accommodate attached flashlight. :
Bike Handcuff Case Safariland 4250 $16.99
Bike Magazine Case Safariland 4110 $29.99
Bike Flashlight Case Safariland 4230 $17.99
Bike Belt Keepers Safariland 4200 $14.99 a set
Bike Gloves Hatch CTM 100 $29.99
Glasses Wiley X Romer li $84.99
8RT Uniforms/Equlpment
Sure Fire SureFire X300 Weapons mounted light $264.99
Blackhawk Omega $74.99
Holster Drop Holster
Boots NB Boots 811BK New Balance Black Discontinued
Leather Gear
Bianchi Acumold
i Duty belt with tri- ” $59.99
Garrison Belt reloase Buckle Basket Weave 2.25” Duty Belt
#7950
Liner Belt for Acumold Duty | Bianchi Liner Belt ' ;
Belt #7205 2 1/4', fully lined, basket weave $28.99
Off Duty Weapon Holster Blackhawk CQC For Glock 17; pricing for be]t mounting and $59.99
paddle mounting
Cuff Case ASF EXeSrse Lightweight, Rapid Deployment, Snap-loc 2500
#56130
. ) Boston Leather
Chemical Spray Carrier #5535-3 Basket weave for Freeze +P spray $24.99

Page 13 of 18




. Boston Leather Basket weave for Streamlight Stinger LED $29.99
Flashlight Holder #5491-3 HL
) . . a Basket weave, double with snaps; gold for $39.99
Magazine Carrier kit e command, silver for officers and sergeants
Belt Keepers Boston Leather Basket weave $2.99
Belt Badge Holder Boston Leather Die-Cut for badge B-251 $18.99
Neck Badge Holder Perfect Fit #706 With Chain $19.99
Badge Case Strong #B251 Leather $24.99
Magazine / Cuff Holder | Safariland #2601 Basket weave Ly
Equipment
ASP Ultra Plus
Handcuffs #56061 (chain) Ultra Plus $68.00
#56070 (Hinge) $78.00
: Premier Crown ; ; 169.00
Riot Helmet PC-6006 With Shield and Neck Protector FXR $
Flashlight Streamlight #75455 Stinger DS LED Flashlight $159.99
ANSI 107-2015 Type P Class 2, Zip Front $59.99
Traffic Vest Blauer 343P Break Away
Clipboard Saunders #10003 8 3/4" x 14" Aluminum $24.99
Ticket Book Holder Saunders #12205 5" x 12" Aluminum $32.99
Binoculars Bushnell 10x50 Insta-Focus $60.00
Range Glasses Silencio Clear Lens $8.99
Gloves Hatch RFK300 Cut Resistant glove $39.99
Accessories/ Brass :
. . Silver - Officers / Sergeants, $69.99
Shirt Badge Blackinton B251 Gold - Command
. Silver - Officers / Sergeants, $69.99
Jacket Badge Blackinton B562 Gold - Command
: Silver - Officers / Sergeants, $64.99
Hat Badge Blackinton B616 Gold - Command
Blackinton B251 Silver - Officers / Sergeants, $64.99
\aleiBaugs Flat Gold - Command
Silver - Officers / Sergeants,
Name Plate Blackinton A2388 Gold - Command Black Letters, Pin & $14.99
Clasp Back
Silver - Officers / Sergeants,
Tie Bar Blackinton Gold - Command State Seal w/ "Novi $17.99
Police" engraved
Collar VI Blackinton Silver - Custom made "VI" $8.99 per piece
CoIIarg :rrg;g:]s;gma i Blackinton Chevron. 3 Stripes $9.50
Collar Rank Insignia - . ) $15.99
Lisitahant Blackinton A1973 Gold bar, Flat finish
Collar Ra"'gh"iz'fg"'a “ASSt | Biackinton A3731 3 Gold Stars $24.99
Collar Rank Insignia - Chief | Blackinton A3731 4 Gold Stars $20.99
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Coat Epaulet Rank Insignia . : $15.99
- Lieutenant Blackinton A1973 Gold bar, Flat finish
Coat Epaulet Rank Insignia
- Asst. Chief Blackinton A3731 3 Gold Stars $24.99
Coat Epaulet Rank Insignia | gjackinton A3731 4 Gold Stars $29.99
Silver - Officers / Sergeants, $6.00
Whistle Acme Thunderer Gold - Command W/Tooth Protector
. . } Silver - Officers / Sergeants, 3.99
Whistle Chain Blackinton V313 Gold - Command $
Hat Bands Blackinton V298 Black - Officers, Silver — Sergeants, $12.00

Gold - Command

* Price to include badge tab and supplier to sew on two (2) Police Department furnished shoulder patches.

We acknowledge the following addendums:

Bid prices include on-site maaservlces:
‘@ No

References are attached:

Exceptions to specifications/Comments:

Yes No

Company name
Address
City, State Zip
Phone
Fax
Agent's Name
Agent's Signature
Agent's Title
Date

Allie Brothers Uniforms

20295 Middliebelt Road

Livonia, Ml 48152

248-477-4434

248-477-1416

Ryt

A [llb_

\‘Icu President

525123
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CLIY OF

cityofnovi.org

BID FORM - FIRE DEPARTMENT UNIFORMS

CITY OF NOVI

We the undersigned as bidder, propose to furnish to the City of Novi, according to the
Conditions and instructions attached hereto and made a part thereof for the following price:

* Price to include badge tab and supplier is to sew on two (2) Fire Department furnished shoulder patches

Brand/Style # Additional description Unit Price
SHIRTS/JACKETS
Long(l\? :,3\)/9 Sl Elbeco G974 65% poly/35% cotton with Nano Tex $47.99
Lid H
ShoerS :3;\)’8 S Elbeco G964 65% poly/35% cotton with Nano Tex g
Polo Shirt 5.11(Navy 5.11 71049 Name embroidered in white on right $63.99
or Grey) ’ chest, small patch sewn on left chest
Dark blue wireflective ‘Novi
 Jacket HI Vis Fire/Rescue’ in scotch-lite on back. $305.00
(Navy) 5.11 48073 Name embroidered in white on right
y chest with Velcro tab small patch
sewn on left chest
** Long Sleeve Shirt $41.99
%White) Elbeco 310 100% poly TexTrop
** Short Sleeve Shirt $39.99
(White) Elbeco 3310 100% poly TexTrop
Job Shirt (Navy) Flex Name embroidered in white on right
Tech Quarter Zip Elbeco B s chest, small patch sewn on left chest $74.99
. Class A double-breasted, 55%
(N g/;(a)sl:s)rglszuai?f(:)ar% Elbeco #13750 poly/45% wool NFD patches on $229.99
sleeves Includes striping & stars
100% cotton, with silkscreened logo $12.00
T-Shirt Fruit of the Loom Heavy | as specified by Fire Dept. (Minimum
of 12 to be ordered at one time)
57% Polyester/28% Wool/15% $114.99
** Sweater Fleece Blauer #225 Acrylic with 100% Polyester Fleece
Lived V-Neck backing fabric with name and badge
tab.
PANTS
Uniform Pants (Navy) Elbeco E814 65% poly/35% cotton with Nano Tex 547.99
Cargo Pants (Navy) Elbeco E614 65% poly/35% cotton with TekTwill $69.99
.ﬁ,':us: eg?gg\rjy) Elbeco E1360 Class A, 55% polyester/45% wool 72139
with Scotchlite on sleeves and
*Coveralls (Navy) ankles and down the front, $29.99

Red Cap #CT10NV

silkscreened logo as specified by
Fire Dept.

Page 16 of 18




HATS

Serge: black band for firefighters,

.99
Fire Cap (Navy) Hankin Bros #5-1-1 silver for Lieutenants, Gold Captain 4
and above
wool, with embroidered logo as $12.99
Ball Cap (Navy) Broder Flexfit #6477 specified by Fire Dept.
with embroidered logo as specified
Watch Cap (Black) Broner Super Stretch by Fire Dept. $7.99
MISCELLANEOUS '
. . Silver w one horn for Lieutenants, $34.99
Hat Badge (Nickel) Blackinton # B500 Gold for Captains two homs.
Uniform Tie (Black) Samuel Broome Wool, clip-on $6.99
B/W Fire Belt (Black) Tex Shoemaker $32.99
. . Siler with State seal for firefighters
Unlfo;?dzardeg; c(j)SlIver Blackinton #B1009 and Lieutenants Gold with State seal $65.99
for Captains and Above.
Uniform Collar ) ) ) $13.99
Insignia (Gold) #A6981 Captain All gold; round with 2 horns
Uniform Collar . . " $13.99
Insignia (Silver ) #AB985 Lieutenant All silver, round with 1 horn
. . . State of Michigan Seal with "Novi $16.99
Tie Bars (Silver) Blackinton Fire" engraved
. . State of Michigan Seal with "Novi $16.99
Tie Bars (Gold) Blackinton Fire" engraved
Silver - Firefighters / Lieutenants $14.50
Name Tags Blackinton A2388 Gold - Captains and Administration
Black Letters, Pin & Clasp Back
OVERSIZE
Work Pant (Navy) sizes 48 & up
**Short Sleeve Shirt XXL
**Short Sleeve Shirt XXXL
**Long Sleeve Shirt XXL
*Long Sleeve Shirt XXXL
T-Shirt XXL
T-Shirt XXXL
**Coveralls 50/52
**Coveralls 54/56
**Coveralls 58/60
**Jacket Size 50 - 52
**Jacket Size 54 & up
ALTERATIONS
(OVERSIZE ONLY)
Pants
Shirts
Jacket
Coverall
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** Price to include badge tab and supplier is to sew on two (2) Fire Department furished shoulder patches

We acknowledge the following addendums:

Bid prices Includes on-site measuring irvices O ’/ No

References are attached:
Exceptions to Specifications /| Comments:

Company name Allie Brothers Uniforms
Address 20295 Middlebelt Road
City, State Zip Livonia, MI 48152
Phone 248-477-4434
Fax 248-477-1416

Agent's Name @E%rt Allie

Agent's Signature "?("/ ML

Agent's Title (J&:e President

Date 5|25(23
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