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CITY of NOVI CITY COUNCIL

Agenda ltem. 2
April 7, 2014

NOV
cityofnovi.org
SUBJECT: Approval to award two-year Aggregate Materials Contracts, each with a single one-
year renewable option, to five separate firms (Dani's Transport Inc., Edward C. Levy Inc.,
Ellsworth Industries Inc., Osburn Industries Inc., and Target Trucking LLC) based on unit
pricing for each material, for a fotal estimated amount of $131,905.

SUBMITTING DEPARTMENT: Department of Public Services - Field Operations Division@

CITY MANAGER APPROVAL: I/

EXPENDITURE REQUIRED $131,905 (estimated)

AMOUNT BUDGETED $475,000 Major Roads Routine Maintenance
$505,000 Local Roads Routine Maintenance

APPROPRIATION REQUIRED $0

LINE ITEM NUMBER 202-202.00-866.000 (50%)
203-203.00-844.000 (50%)

BACKGROUND INFORMATION:
Aggregate materials (i.e. gravel, stone, sand) are used in a variety of road and drain

maintenance work activities. An invitation to bid was publically advertised on the
Michigan Intergovernmental Trade Network (MITN) and five bids were received (see
attached invitation to bid, and bid tabulation). The following table summarizes the
attached bids, with the lowest responsive, responsible bidder listed in each category of

material.
Estimated

Materials Tons Company Price Per Ton Total Cost
Natural Sand 2NS 300 Target Trucking $10.50 $3,150
Fill Sand (Bank Run) 300 Target Trucking 5.80 1,740
21A Limestone 500 Dani's Transport 12.85 6,425
*Alternate for 21A: Slag 500 Edward C. Levy 11.71 5,855
21AA Limestone 1500 Dani's Transport 12.85 19,279
**Alternate for 21 AA: Slag 1500 Edward C. Levy 11.71 17,565
22A Natural 1800 Ellsworth Ind. 9.85 17.730
23A Natural 400 Ellsworth Ind. 92.85 3,940
34R Peastone 200 Target Trucking 14.75 2,950
4G Limestone 200 Dani's Transport 14.25 2,850
6A Natural 1500 Dani's Transport 14.10 21,150
6A Limestone (3/4') 100 Dani's Transport 14.30 1,430
4A Limestone 1000 Dani's Transport 18.25 18,250
1"X3" Limestone 400 Dani's Transport 14.10 5,640
2"X4"

Landscape/Floatstone 400 Dani's Transport 21.00 8,400
4"X8" Rip Rap 100 Dani's Transport 18.25 1,825
3x1 Blast Furnace Slag 100 Dani's Transport 15.50 1,550
Chloride Treated Sand 4600 Osburn Ind. 26.00 15,600

Total Estimated Cost: $131,905



The City of Northville was added to the bid as an alternate customer (as part of a "shared
services" initiative). Northville will be awarding a contract separately based on the unit
pricing Novi received.

The contract term is two years. Upon mutual consent of the City and each supplier, prices
will remain firm for one additional year. Contracts will be awarded to these firms for the

respective estimated amounts shown.

Supplier Estimated 2-Year Contract Value
Dani's Transport $86,795

Ellsworth Ind. $21,670

Osburn Ind. $15,600

Target Trucking $7.840

Total: $131,905

The alternate product to both 21A and 21AA Limestone is slag, which DPS has not used
previously. Slag is a reusable “green" byproduct created in the production of different
types of iron that is processed to mirror limestone properties. Because of the ability to
process slag into a product similar to limestone, a contract will also be awarded to the
Edward C. Levy Co. for lower priced slag material. The estimated value of slag to be
purchased ($23,420), does not increase the overall estimated expenditure to fund the
other contracts. However, it could reduce the per ton cost for 21A and 21 AA Limestone
by $1.14/ton ($12.85/ton base material - $11.71/ton slag cost = $1.14 potential
savings/ton), if the alternate is found acceptable when used in the field. If the slag
materials perform favorably, a significant savings could be reflected in the estimated
expenditure required over the life of the contract.

RECOMMENDED ACTION: Approval to award two-year Aggregate Materials Contracts, each

with a single one-year renewable option, to five separate firms (Dani's Transport Inc.,
Edward C. Levy Inc., Ellsworth Industries Inc., Osburn Industries Inc., and Target Trucking
LLC) based on unit pricing for each material, for a total estimated amount of $131,905.

Mayor Gatt Council Member Markham

Mayor Pro Tem Staudt

Council Member Mutch

Council Member Casey

Council Member Wrobel

Council Member Fischer




CITY OF NOVI MARCH 20, 2014
AGGREGATE MATERIALS BID TAB 2:00 P.M.
Osburn Ellsworth
Description Industries Industries Dani's Transport Edw.C. Levy Co. Target Trucking|
Natural Sand
1. |2NS 10.85 10.75 10.60 TN 11.27 10.50
Fill Sand
2. |(Bank Run) 6.88 7.25 6.10 TN 6.92 5.80
3. |21A Limestone 14.50 13.25 12.85 TN il i 14.35
4, [21AA Limestone 14.50 13.26 12.85 TN it 14.40
5. |22A Natural 10.25 9.85 10.10 TN 10.13 10.00
6. |23A Natural 10.25 9.85 10.10 TN 10.13 10.00
7. |34R (Peastone) 15.00 15.20 14.85 TN 14.99 14.75
8. |4G Limestone 17.50 14.75 14.25 15.71 % No Bid
9. |6A Natural 16.00 15.20 14.10 TN 15.99 15.25
10. |6A Limestone 16.60 15.95 14.30 TN 22.64 16.25
11. |4A Limestone no bid 19.25 18.25 N/A No Bid
1" X3
12. |Limestone 15.60 16.95 14.10 TN N/A 15.65
2" x 4"
13. [Landscape/Float 27.00 126.75% 21.00 TN N/A 34.75
14. |4” — 8" Rip Rap 23.50 27.50 18.25 TN N/A 21.50
3 X 1 Blast
15. |Furnace Slag 16.25 18.50 15.50 TN N/A 15.60
Chloride-treated
16. [Sand 26.00 28.90 N/A No Bid ¢
*Alternate bid 21AA BF
4A Limestone is [for 21A & 21AA LS.
called OH #4's at Alternate bid 4G BF for
Deviations Stoneco 4G LS
Extend to MITN No No No No No

* Substitute offered. See Deviations comments.

** Price confirmed with contractor.
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CONTRACT FOR AGGREGATE MATERIALS

This Agreement shall be considered as made and entered into as of the date of the last
signature (“Effective Date”), and is between the City of Novi, a Michigan municipal
corporation, whose address is 45175 W. Ten Mile, Novi, Michigan 48375, (hereinafter
referred to as “Client”), and , Wwhose address is ;
(hereinafter referred to as “Contractor”).

THE CLIENT AND CONTRACTOR AGREE AS FOLLOWS:

Article I Statement and Performance of Work.

w5
>ontfractor shall provide the
§I‘lhe "Work"), which
e, in a competent,
e and responsible

For payment by the Client as provided under this Contract;
materials and provide the services described on and in Sch
is attached hereto and made a part of this Contract by this refer:
accurate, efflcn—:-m‘ ’rlmely good professional, ’fhorough compl

Article 11 Timing of Performance.

Performance of this Contract sh {
2016. Upon mutual consent of thg

renewed one (1) additional year"
original contract.

Article lll.  Contract Pri¢

thirty (30) days of recei
mo‘rendfs__prowd and ‘W ;ark performed in connection with the billing and the hours
_'le { ). BCICh such item. Such itemized b!l!lngs shcl] be subrmﬁed

______ ncurred by Contractor under this Contract are deemed to be
included in the c:mounfs set forth in Schedule A. Contractor will obtain written
approval of the Client prior to proceeding with any work that is not stated on Schedule
A; otherwise, the Client will not be billed for such extra/additional work.

Payments shall be made upon verification of invoices received by the Client. All
payments to Contractor shall be submitted by mail at Contractor's address first listed
above, unless Contractor provides written notice of a change in the address to which
such payments are to be sent.
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A.

Article IV: Termination.

1. For cause: In the event that either party shall breach the terms and conditions of
this Contract, the aggrieved party may nofify the other party, in writing via certified
mail, of such breach and demand that the same be remedied within ten (10) days.
If the defaulting party fails to remedy the breach as demanded, the aggrieved
party shall then have the right to terminate by giving the defaulting party thirty (30)
days written notice. In addition, if at any time a voluntary petition in bankruptcy
shall be filed against either party and shall not be dismissed within thirty (30) days, or
if either party shall take advantage of any insolvency law, or if a receiver or trustee
of any of a party’s property shall be appointed and suc tfi}i??poinfments shall not be
vacated within thirty (30) days, the other party shall hay > he right, in addition to any
4 or in eguity, to terminate

other rights of whatsoever nature that it may have asr'-'[ct
by giving thirty (30) days notice in writing of such terminat

2 For convenlence The CllenT ‘may Termmoi ’rhe Ggreem 8] ¢ wholef'or in part,

under the terms of thi§
the Clienf shaill only

independent com c:’ror cmd/or vendor, and no liability or responsibility with respect
to benefits of any: §l'<md including without limitation, medical benefits, worker's
compensation;pe nsion rights, or other rights or liabilities arising out of or related to a
confract for hire or employer/employee relationship shall arise or accrue to either
party as a result of the performance of this Contract.

Conftractor, as an independent contractor and/or vendor, is not authorized to enter
into or sign any agreements on behalf of the Client or to make any representations
to third parties that are binding upon the Client.

Confractor represents that it will dedicate sufficient resources and provide dall
necessary personnel required to perform the work described in Schedule A in
accordance with the terms and conditions of this Contract. Except as may be
specifically stated and agreed to in Schedule A, Contractor shall perform all of the
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work under this Contract and no other person or entity shall be assigned or sub-
contracted to perform the work, or any part thereof, unless approved by the Client
in advance.

Article VI: Liability and Insurance.

A. Contractor agrees to indemnify and hold harmless the Client, its elected and
appointed officials and employees, from and against any and all claims, demands,
suits, losses and settlements, including actual attorney fees incurred and all costs
connected therewith, for any damages which may pe asserted, claimed or
recovered against the Client by reason of (i) personal i |nJ Jiy, death and/or property
damages which arises out of or is in any way connggted or associated with the

c:chons or macﬂons of ConTrc:c?or in performlng or failing.to perfprm the work; or (||]

of or damage to such properfy and
performance of this Contract.

Contractor shall provide evidence:c c " insurance coverage in the types
? .attached hereto and incorporated

relevant to the work belong exclusively to the Client and shall be promptly delivered to
the Client upon the termination of this Contract or, at any time, upon the Client's

request.
Article VIlI: General Provisions.

A. Entire Agreement. This instrument, together with the attached Schedules, contains
the entire Contract between the Client and Contractor. No verbal agreement,
conversation, or representation by or between any officer, agent, or employee of
the parties hereto, either before or after the execution of this Contract, shall affect
or modify any of the terms or obligations herein contained.
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B. Compliance with Laws. This Contract and all of Contractor’'s work and practices

H.

shall be subject to all applicable state, federal and local laws, ordinances, rules or
regulations, including without limitation, those which apply because Client is a
public governmental agency or body. Contractor represents that it is in
compliance with all such laws and eligible and quadlified to enter into this Contract.

Governing Law. This Contract shall be governed by the laws of the State of
Michigan.

Assignment. Contractor shall not assign this Contract or )Efr%;bcr’r thereof without the
written consent of the Client. This Contract shall b nding on the parties, their

successors, assigns and legal representatives.

n-shall clearly
wrl’r’ren fesponse form ’rhe
other party, and culminate in a fac .
action is possible. In no eventishall this: 355/ than thirty (30) days,
unless a specific extended pefi iod-of fime _gréed to by b\oTh parties in writing as
belng necessary. The aforemet (

g';;;for the poymen’rs under this Contract from one or more
private sources, andit is understood by Conftractor that it is hired by Client to work
exclusively for Clight (and by extension for the Township should the work be
accepted and:in plemented by the Township) and Contractor agrees that no
private party or parties will be allowed to hold sway or influence, in any way, over
Contractor's performance of the work.

Notices. Written notices under this Conftract shall be given to the parties at their
addresses contained in this Contract by personal or registered mail delivery to the
attention of the following persons:

Client: Assistant City Manager Victor Cardenas and City Clerk Maryanne Cornelius
Contractor:

Changes. Any changes in the provisions of this Contract must be in writing and
signed by the Client and Conftractor.
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WITNESS AND DATES
OF SIGNATURES:

Waivers. No waiver of any term or condition of this Contract shall be binding and
effective unless in writing and signed by all parties, with any such waiver being
limited to that circumstance only and not applicable to subsequent actions or

events.

Jurisdiction and Venue of Contract. This Contract shall be considered for all

purposes, including the establishment of jurisdiction and venue in any court action
between the parties, as having been entered into and consummated in the City of
Novi, Oakland County, Michigan.

ween the above provisions

Conflict. In the event of any conflict or inconsistency
dules, the provisions in the
]

of this Contract and either or both of the attached S
above text shall govern.

WITNESS AND'DATES CONTRACTOR
OF SIGNATURES:
By:
Its:
Date:
1275476.3
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Company Name D& S Ve g Por T

CILY OF

CITY OF NOVI
BID FORM

g5

oo AGGREGATE MATERIALS
cityofnovi.org
We the undersigned as bidder, propose to furnish to the City of Novi, according to the

specifications, terms, conditions and instructions attached hereto and made a part thereof. All
prices are fixed and firm at the amounts listed below for the entire contract period upon award

of the contract by City Council.

'_-“: sl cn s el e e S TONS B {ALTERNATE .#]._ | Unit Price/Ton
fom | arRA | ey | ATERNATERL SR
Sl e e e

' || Natural Sand 2ns 300 M )0.00 o
2 | Fil Sand (Bank Run) 300 i W .o e
3 21A Limestone 500 100 & .S e
4 | 21AA Limestone 1,500 150 PR
5 |l 224 Natural 1,800 ‘fi_;o. 1940
& |l 23A Natural 400 % 0. 1070
7 34R (Peastone) 200 ¥ [L[,QJ{TJ
8 |l 4G Limestone 200 }"«l 25
' O
9 | 6A Natural 1,500 % 14 %
10 6A Limestone(3/4") 100 r&, IL\, Buﬂj
11 || 4A Limestone 1,000 1425
12 |[ 1"X 3" Limestone 400 % ™My
2" x 4" Land Float
13 | fiohe (andscapelfioa 400 1 21.°%p
14 | 4"-8"Rip Rop 100 ; N)9.2% )
15 || 3X 1 Blast Furnace Slag 100 M50
16 Chloride-treated Sand 600

ORDERING PROCEDURES:

Contact person _\rdq Ofeyas
Telephone number 1 34- 379-91¢©
Hours of operation__1:.0¢ An = 5100 fm

Minimum order quantity _5© e s




L -
Materials will be delivered within O? , hours after order is called Iin.

DEVIATIONS/EXCEPTIONS:

Any suggested deviations from the specifications, terms and conditions shall be

provided in the space provided below, or on an attached summary sheet.
94 bimestope [y _ealled N FYS 4T Sfoseco

COMMENTS:

REFFERENCES: Please provide at least three client (3) references within the last 3 years:

Company L))P.l;l Jask! (Dot ;'Tirf Tl iTies Au.-f'/;er 1T
Address L) STATR ST &};”S oty i
Phone 237 36§ 0035~ Contact name f{e envas Coromfl

Company_OAR'S v ¢p ,/,;?z.,,:jr,,»
Address|AT S5 28um.leacl $holb g Tl i S35
Phone 810210 - 571 | Contact name _ 22V Rupers bucy

Compqny QI)\ U(J-,f"S.; Pl; (! J:;L £ AP 1". :J?“
Address al D) pnode  ym e
Phone/SY - 21(-0875_ Contact name £ ys &S Moo
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CITY OF NOVI
AGGREGATE MATERIALS

Please return this page with your bid form

If your company is awarded the item(s) referenced in the bld proposal, other governmental
entities may wish o use this contract and will issue a purchase order or contract for the item(s)
awarded in the bid proposal following minimum order/contract requirements set forth in the bid
documents. Each entity will provide thelr own purchase order and delivery location(s) and must
be involced separately to the address indicated on their purchase order.

1. EXTENSION OF AWARD TO THE MITN (MICHIGAN INTER-GOVERNMENTAL TRADE NETWORK)
PURCHASING COOPERATIVE: OPTIONAL

Numerous Counties, Citles, Townships, and Authorities of the State of Michigan are members of
the MITN (Michigan Inter-governmental Trade Network) Purchasing Cooperative, Other
associate entities are also members of the Cooperative in the Tri-County area, Please visit
www.mitn.Info webslte to view the entire list of participating agencies.

() If an award is made fo , it is agreed that the contract will
be extended to other MITN Purchasing Cooperative members and associate entities under the
same prices, terms, and conditions,

() Our company is NOT interested in extending the contract to those MITN members listed on
the webslte,

ConiracforSigna?ure [O.,.J;w ) B"} gl
Company Name: S2A#1°S 'T‘?‘/}—N)PMT
14

Date; 5 f’ I
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We acknowledge receipt of the following Addenda:

(please indicate numbers)

This bid is submitted by:

Company (Legal Registration) bﬂ DS Trads PocT

Address 5 ) 0O ')Qf?-ﬂ‘—'z‘-? L)J
city . Roe K Waod state I Zip 5/ § 7?
Telephone 723 {- 379 - 7100 Fax_/34-327-9/ 1

f
Representative's Name (please print) /7111' J‘f ¢ De et o)

Representative's Title Grovern C i} <

Representative's Signature /ﬂ/‘% ﬂ%/’?f‘“

E-mail A6 Bry 6‘1“'@ PASITrA Uy fo (7, Co A
Date £ - /9 /L/
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Company Name Edward C, Levy Co.

CITY.

CITY OF NOVI
BID FORM

AGGREGATE MATERIALS

cityofnovl.org

We the undersigned as bidder, propose to furnish 1o the Cily of Novi, according to the
specificailons, terms, conditions and Instructions attached hereto and made a parf thereof, All
prices are fixed and firm at the amounts listed below for the entire contract period upon award

of the confract by City Councll.

_ : “pOfENTIAL | POTENTIALTONS N
e ] TONS, ANNUALLY | unit Price/Ton
et ff« . . .- ; — AN (ALTERNATE #1--| .~ "%
o R :‘IMA)T,ERI& S = ANNUALLY | .. GITY.OF - . (delivered)
i i o INOVI [ NORTHYILLE) - .
1 Natural Sand 2NS 300 $11.27
2| Filsand (Bank Run) 300 250 %6.62
3 21A Limestone 500 100 $11.71
4 | 21AA Umestone 1,500 150 $11.71
51 224 Natural 1,800 $10.13
8 23A Natural 400 $10.13
7|l a4R [Peastone) 200 $14.99
8 | 4G Umestone 200 $15.71
? 6A Natural 1,500 $15.99
10 6A I.Imesione(SM“) 100 $22.64
11 || 4A Limestone 1,000 NIA
12 | 1" X 3" Limestone 400 N/A
13 giuo J§1 g" Landscape/Float 400 KU
14 | 4"-8"Rip Rap 100 NIA
15 3 X 1 Blast Furnace Slag 100 N/A
16 || Chloride-treated Sand 600 NIA

— —

ORDERING PROCEDURES:

S
Contact person S2/es Depariment

Te|ephone number (313) 429-5389
7:00am - 5:00pm

Hours of operation
Minimum order quantity

50 fons




48h
Materlals will be dellvered within e hours after order Is called in.

DEVIATIONS/EXCEPTIONS:

Any suggested deviations from the specifications, terms and conditions shall be

provided in the spdce provided below, or on an attached summary sheet.
Alternate bid 21AA BF for 21A and 21AA LS,

Alternale bid 4G BF for 4G LS.

(o{@) ENTS:
REFFERENCES: Please provide at least three cllent (3) references within the last 3 years:
Company City of Southgate
Address 1400 Dix-Toledo, Soulhgate, M| 48195
Phone 734-246-1310 Contact name Iris Slaven
Company City of Dearborn Helghts
Address 6045 Fenton, Dearborn Helghls, Ml 48127
Phone 313-277-7924 Contact name Bert Warner
Company Cily of Taylor
Address 25605 Northline, Taylor, M1 48180
Gerald

Phong, 734-267-6650 Contact name
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N/A

We acknowledge recelpt of the following Addenda:
(please indicate numbers)

This bid is submiited by:

dC. Levy Co,
Company [Legal Registration) = & 12

8800 Dix Ave,
Address
Delrolt Mi 48209
City State Zip
313-429-5389 313-429-2448
Telephone Fax

Roberl W, Nobbs

Répresentaﬂve's Name (please print)

o Direclor of Aggregale Sales and Markelin
Representative's Title ey ’

A =
Representative's Signalture _ ? /

lellis@edwclevy.net

E-mail
03-17-2014

Date
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CITY OF NOVI
AGGREGATE MATERIALS

Please return this page with your bid form

If your company Is awarded the item(s) referenced In the bld proposal, other governmential
entities may wish 1o use this contract and will Issue a purchase order or contract for the item(s)
awarded In the bld proposal following minimum order/contract requirements sef forth In the bid
documenis, Ecich entily will provide their own purchase order and delivery location(s) and must
be Involced separately 1o the address Indicated on thelr purchase order.

1, EXTENSION OF AWARD TO THE MITN (MICHIGAN INTER-GOVERNMENTAL TRADE NETWORK)
PURCHASING COOPERATIVE: OPTIONAL

Numerous Counties, Cifies, Townshlps, and Authorities of the State of Michigan are members of
the MITN (Michigan Inter-governmental Trade Network) Purchasing Cooperative. Other
assoclate entltles are clso members of the Cooperative In the Trl-Counly area. Pledse visit

www.mitn.info webslte 1o view the entire list of participaling agencles,

If an award Is made to , It Is agreed that the coniract will
be extended to other MITN Purchasing Cooperative members and assoclate entities under the
same prices, lerms, and conditions.

Our company Is NOT Interested In extending the contract to those MITN members listed on
e

websile,

Confractor Signalure;

Company Name: Edward C. Levy Co.
Date: 03-17-2014
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MATERIAL SAFETY DATA SHEET
TRADE NAME: Blast Furnace Slag SYNONYMS: Air Cooled, ACBF, BF Slag

I PRODUCT AND COMPONENT DATA

Component(s): CAS Registry % (Approx.) ACGIH TLV-TWA
Blast Furnace Slag 65996-69-2 100 None Known
Composition of BF Slag

Normal Range

Si0;: 32 -42%
A'Izﬁa: 7-11%
Ca0: 35-45%
MgO: 7 -15%
FeO: 0.1-0.7%
S: 1.0-2.5%

These constituents usually exist as an isomorphic mixture with the following general
formula: Cay(MgFeAl) (SiAl),0;

This formula represents the melilite mineral series.

Some of the constituents may also occur as separate compounds such as those listed below:
CaCo;, CasS, Fe, Fey0s, CaS04. 2H,0

Il. PHYSICAL DATA
. SOLUBILITY: CaS, CaC0;, FLASH POINT: None
STABILITY: Stable FLAMMABLE LIMITS: None

SPECIFIC GRAVITY: 2.3-2.4 Air Cooled

APPEARANCE & ODOR: Grayish, vesicular, stony material, may have slight sulfurous
odor when exposed to heat greater than 200 degrees F.

ll. . PERSONAL PROTECTION AND CONTROLS

RESPIRATORY: If airborne concentrations exceed recommended exposure
limits, a suitable NIOSHIMSHA approved filter respirator
should be worn. General ventilation or local exhaust is
normally adequate to control dust emissions, if not
engineering controls should be utilized.




EYE: : Safety glasses with side shields should be worn as minimum
protection from impact. Dust goggles should be worn when
excessively dusty conditions are present or anticipated.

GENERAL: The use of hard hats and hard toed shoes is recommended.
Gloves may be worn to protect from abrasion.

IV.  FIRSTAID
INHALATION: Remove to fresh air. *
SKIN: Wash with soap and water,
EYE: Flush with water immediately. *
*Note: If irritation is aggravated or persists, contact a physician.
V. HEALTH HAZARDS
" EXPOSURE LIMITS: ACGIH TLV's
Total Dust: 10mg/M3 < 1 % quartz
Respirable dust: 5mg/M3 <1 % quartz
MEDICAL CONDITIONS AGGRAVATED BY EXPOSURE:
Exposure to dust may cause irritation to the skin, eyes,
or respiratory system or may aggravate existing skin, eye,
or respiratory system disease.
ROUTE OF EXPOSURE: Inhalation
ACUTE TOXICITY: Exposure to dust may irritate the respiratory system,
eyes, or skin.
CHRONIC TOXICITY: Blast furnace slag is not listed on the NTP, IARC, or OSHA
lists of carcinogens.
VI. STORAGE AND SPECIAL PRECAUTIONS
Respirable dust may be generated during I:Jrocessing, handling, and storage. Use personal
protective equipment as noted in Section IIl.
SPILL. LEAK, AND DISPOSAL METHODS

\l

Pick up mechanically or by hand tools and reuse or dispose of as a common non-hazardous
material in accordance with applicable Federal, State, and local laws. Wetting the material prior
to cleanup may be necessary to suppress dust; use personal protective equipment as




described in Section IIl.

VIil. TRANSPORTATION

DOT Hazard Classification and placard not required. Some areas require the use of tarps
on frucks for containment of dust.

A

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION

Contact: THE LEVY COMPANY Business hours: 1-219-462-2924
Post Office Box 540
Portage, IN 46368

ISSUED: January 2009 SUPERCEDES: January 2002

DISCLAIMER:
The data supplied in this Material Safety Data Sheet is, to the best of our knowledge and belief,

accurate and reliable. The Levy Company does not warrant or guarantee their accuracy or
reliability, and will not be liable for any loss or damage arising out of the use thereof. The
information contained herein is offered for the user's consideration, examination, and

determination of suitability.




SDLUT[DNS F
YOLUR ENVIRCGNMENT™ 8800 Dix Ave., Detroit, Ml 48209

Weekly Product Conformance Report
For Week of March 03 2014 to March 08 2014

Product:
Location:

State Pit Number:

21AA Blast Furnace Slag
Edw. C. Levy Co., Plant #2

82-20

14/2" 1" 34" | /2" | 38" | #4 #8

U.S.Sieve i
Metric Sieve _{37.5mm) 25.0mm| 19.0mm} 12.5mm| 9.5mm |4.75mm)2.36mm|
MDOT SpeCIflcatlon 100 [85-100f - |50-75| - - | 20-45| 4-10
e Passmg [ TR S NN RS [T N S N
2013 Shipping Average 100 97 85 67 57 ! 41 30 4.4
Feburary 2014 Average 100 99 89 74 65 48 35 4.7
Week of 03/03/2014 100 | 99 | 88 | 73 63 | 47 35 | 5.4

Average Physical Property Data

Shipping Moisture (2013 Average) - 5.4%

ASTM C 29, Loose Unit Weight (2013 Average) - 99 I/t

ASTM C 29, Rodded Unit Weight (2013 Average) - 108 Ib/ft®

ASTM C 131, Abrasion and Impact in the Los Angeles Machine #

A Not applicable to Blasl Furnace Slag, sea Mich)

This Informalion Is not lo be laken as warranty or representallon for which wa

Depariment of Transporalion "2012 Slandard Specificallons for Construclion” Tabla 902-2

lagal responsibility nor as pormission or

to practice any patenled Invention without a licanse, Il s offered solely for your conslderation, Invesligation and verification,




YOUR ENVIRONMEMNT ™

8800 Dix Ave., Detrolt, MI 48209

Weekly Product Conformance Report
For Week of March 03 2014 to March 08 2014

Product: 4G Blast Furnace Slag
Location: Edw. C. Levy Co., Plant #2
State Pit Number:  82-20
U.S.Sieve 11/2" " 3/4" 112" 3/8" #4 #8 #30 i LBl
Metric Sieve 37.5mm|25.0mm|19.0mm|12.5mm| 9.5mm |4.75mm|2.36mm| 600um |
MDOT Speial 100 |85-100{ - | 45-65| - . | 1530 618 | 06
ProvisionSpec | )Ll el It ol
Percent Passing i
2013 Shipping Average 100 92 76 57 46 30 20 10 E 3.
Feburary 2014 Average i No Shipping
Week of 03/03/2014 wr - No Shipping
Average Physical Property Data
Shipping Moisture (2013 Average) - 3.9%
ASTM C 29, Loose Unit Weight (2013 Average) - 95 b/ft®
ASTM C 29, Rodded Unit Weight (2013 Average) - 105 Ib/ft®
ASTM C 131, Abrasion and Impact in the Los Angeles Machine @
4 Nol applicable to Blasl Furnace Slag, see Michigan Deparimenl of Transporialion "2012 Standard S tions for Construcllon” Table 902-2

This Informallon 15 not lo be laken as warranly or represenlalion for which we assume legal responsibility nor as f

tion withoul a license, Itls offered solely for your conslderallon, Investigalion and vedficatlon,

log

lice any palenled |

Weekly Sunmary 20140203, - 46 BFS




Company Name . DS 9TRN N wDWHE-§S

cityofnovi.org

CcllY OF
CITY OF NOVI
BID FORM
I/ AGGREGATE MATERIALS

We the undersigned as bidder, propose to furnish to the City of Novi, according to the
specifications, terms, conditions and instructions attached hereto and made a part thereof. Al
prices are fixed and firm at the amounts listed below for the entire contract period upon award

of the contract by City Council.

Seilli ao it e con i GESETONS s ALTéRNATE:'#"i' | UnitPrice/Ton .
-_“-:em" . MATERIAL. [ ANNUALLY | { CITY-OF | (delivered)

U | Natural Sand 2NS 300 /0,75

2 | Rl sand (Bank Run) 300 250 7 J5

3 | 21A Limestone 500 100 /3 .05

4 | 21AA Limestone 1,500 150 /3,05

5 22A Natural 1,800 ?. 5}5-

6 |l 23A Natural 400 9.85

7 |l 34R (Peastone) 200 /5. >0

8 | 4G Limestone 200 /9. /75

9 6A Natural 1,500 / 5‘ 9\_0

10 [ 6A Limestone(3/4") 100 vy, 75

11 || 4A Limestone 1,000 /95

12 | 1" X 3" Limestone 400 195, 75

14 | 4" -8"Rip Rap 100 27,50

15 || 3 X 1 Blast Furnace Slag 100 /& 5 O

16 | Chloride-treated Sand 600 A8 70

ORDERING PROCEDURES:

Contact person _ A SO MVF\LW\\

Telephone number _ 2x3 = WK -WN\AO

SN\ -\

Hours of operation

Minimum order quantity _ S Q




Materials will be delivered within \'\)\ hours after order is called in.

DEVIATIONS/EXCEPTIONS:

Any suggested deviations from the specifications, terms and conditions shall be
provided in the space provided below, or on an atfached summary sheet,

\\\

i
i

~

COMMENTS:

—

e

™~

ey

REFFERENCES: Please provide at least three client (3) references within the last 3 years:

Company _ X Sx o ©% S oW R AN

Ny
Address _ SUNUSA AWy SeTnan Ty W .

Phone[\'\i_ﬂf N \A\ -\, Contact name _ \Lse \m\

Company __Q “sxa R R Ted W\
Address N BaASERY NealasiaoToe WX,

Phork}b_&&;;ﬁ -8 Contact name _ N A

Company S5O ), 61, C ousity o ey Cossegm
Address _ L 20> ool VD - rﬁ*&\:&us A~

Phoné&l 5§ ?&é YLD  contactname =D

Page 12 of 14




e

We acknowledge receipt of the following Addenda:

(please indicate numbers)

This bid is submiited by:
Company (Legal Registration) RANUNOTEW. —ran, Swlon

Address _ R .©. D oYX D3b
City _ S\ 80Ty State _ SS.. zip_ S\H O
Telephone "\ AN Yo - DALY Fax_ I ~W\GLS -8003\,

Representative's Name (please prinf) _C_ANASIN  TDOHWTE. LT

Representative’s Tifle __RATS SRst

Representative's Signature ‘:&\\

Email NS5V @) o ShORSY - wX
Date QPﬁ’\“‘\“"\\\\"’\

Page 13 of 14



CITY OF NOVI
AGGREGATE MATERIALS

Please return this page with your bid form

If your company is awarded the item(s) referenced in the bid proposal, other governmental
entities may wish to use this contract and will issue a purchase order or contract for the item(s)
awarded in the bid proposal following minimum order/contract requirements set forth in the bid
documents, Each entity will provide their own purchase order and delivery location(s) and must
be involced separately to the address indicated on their purchase order.

1. EXTENSION OF AWARD TO THE MITN (MICHIGAN INTER-GOVERNMENTAL TRADE NETWORK)
PURCHASING COOPERATIVE: OPTIONAL

Numerous Counties, Cities, Townships, and Authorities of the State of Michigan are members of
the MITN (Michigan Inter-governmental Trade Network) Purchasing Cooperative. Other
associate entities are also members of the Cooperative in the Tri-County area. Please visit

www.mitn.info website to view the entire list of participating agencies,

() Ifan award is made to . it Is agreed that the contract will
be extended to other MITN Purchasing Cooperative members and associate entities under the

chices, terms, and conditions.
(/) Our company is NOT interested in extending the contract to those MITN members listed on
the website,

Contractor Signature: \“h\‘\kb

Company Name: _ s \\&s v a SN N &u‘\\\;@:'\ﬁg
Date: %\\Kf\&‘_\‘\‘

Page 14 of 14



Company Name _OSBuln TuibusToies “Tnc

CLEY OF

CITY OF NOVI
BID FORM

AGGREGATE MATERIALS

I cilyolnovi.org

We the undersigned as bidder, propose to furnish to the City of Novi, according to the
specifications, terms, conditions and instructions attached hereto and made a part thereof. All
prices are fixed and firm at the amounts listed below for the entire contract period upon award

of the contract by City Council.

PorENTAL | PORREIALTONS

It TONS (ALTERNATE #1- Unit Price/Ton

S MATERIAL ANNUALLY CITY OF (delivered)
(NOVI)
NORTHVILLE)
! || Natural Sand 2Ns 300 " 10.85
2 |l Fi Sand (Bank Run) 300 o 6. 88
3 || 21A Limestone 500 100 14,50
4 | 21AA Limestone 1,500 150 | Ll .0
5 | 22A Natural 1,800 0.2 5
¢ |l 23A Natural 400 (025
O

d 34R (Peastone) 200 l 5»0
g 4G Limestone 200 I, !'7 0 50
9 [ 6ANatural 1,500 Lé 00
10 || 6A Limestone(3/4") 100 | G .60
11 | 4A Limestone 1,000 M| )6 B rd
12 [ 1" X 3" Limestone 400 | & .60
13 g;:{)’:{éﬂ LGﬂdSCOpEf‘FIOGt 400 &'7. O.@
14 | 4"-8"Rip Rap 100 RN3.50
15 || 3X 1 Blast Furnace Slag 100 | 6.5
16 | Chioride-freated Sand 600 ca’é,.@ o

ORDERING PROCEDURES:
Contact person Jasen Williams -~ Jeff MTHOrﬁ@fs
Telephone number 313 - 3 -HYo EXT-~ JoQkio™

Hours of operation Y > s
50 ‘l‘c)r}

Minimum order quantity




24
Materials will be delivered within hours after order is called in,

DEVIATIONS/EXCEPTIONS:

Any suggested deviations from the specifications, terms and conditions shall be

provided in the space provided below, or on an attached summary sheet,

COMMENTS:

REFFERENCES: Please provide at least three client (3) references within the last 3 years:

Address l".')'(ﬂ.?i‘ W Hnr N EADES
Phone _ 194 T€3- 5587  contact name Cilhg @2 7 ’W}?/ -

Company G ‘JT;/ of T‘il_-{y'{m&»
Address V)L.UiN € P TAYE&L
Phone 7‘&"1"}8 i 860‘-' Contact name \5"6‘0&

Company Ca.‘\fy of Flnn ARBoro

Address EWS 050?'\'” . 7] /]
Phone '73“1 194 - 6350 contact name _ Kurl

Page 12 of 14



We acknowledge receipt of the following Addenda:
(please indicate numbers)

This bid Is submitted by:
Company (Legal Registration) OSPuRN TaousTe ts TEne.

address D850 Pardee.

City Tﬂ ‘}/ lo R State i 1<t 7ib L{ 180
Telephone 613—&q'3 . L'—l‘-|~c~, Fax RB-93 - LHL}%

Representative's Name (please print) | {itny (Jélf)uﬂ’\

7
Representative's Title U i
Representative's Signature :-)TM (,,/_’/l/znr\_,.h

o Tim@® Osburnind , Com
Date SG’RU JLI

Page 13 of 14




CITY OF NOVI
AGGREGATE MATERIALS

Please return this page with your bid form

If your company is awarded the item(s) referenced in the bid proposal, other governmentail
entities may wish to use this contract and will issue a purchase order or contract for the item(s)
awarded in the bid proposal following minimum order/contract requirements set forth in the bid
documents. Each entity will provide their own purchase order and delivery location(s) and must
be invoiced separately to the address indicated on thelr purchase order.

1. EXTENSION OF AWARD TO THE MITN (MICHIGAN INTER-GOVERNMENTAL TRADE NETWORK)
PURCHASING COOPERATIVE: OPTIONAL

Numerous Counties, Cities, Townships, and Authorities of the State of Michigan are members of
the MITN (Michigan Inter-governmental Trade Network) Purchasing Cooperative, Other
associate entities are also members of the Cooperative in the Tri-County area. Please visil
www.mitn.info website to view the entire list of participating agencies.

() Ifan award is made to , it is agreed that the contract will
be extended to other MITN Purchasing Cooperative members and associate entities under the
same prices, terms, and conditions,

(\/} Our company is NOT interested in extending the contract to those MITN members listed on
the website,

Contractor Signature: N j -~ Q‘/?/O"’""‘/

Company Name: OCsbvrn ZIM{LU}W‘& )
Date: 3" 0~ j LI

Page 14 of 14




1. e'f f e k in 4 4l
7

Company Name __fm“l

CITY OF NOVI
BID FORM

AGGREGATE MATERIALS

= 8
cityofnoviog,

We the undersigned as bidder, propose fo furnish fo the City of Novi, according to the
specifications, terms, conditions and instructions attached hereto and made a pari thereof. All
prices are fixed and firm at the amounts listed below for the entire contract period upon award

of the contract by City Council.

POTENTIAI POKNJ:T;LTL?NS
Ite: ot ALTERNATE #1 sbiliiadiod
S MATERIAL ANNUALLY ( = (delivered)
(NOVI) CITY OF
NORTHVILLE)

' | Natural Sand 2Ns 300 \7 0.0

% Fill Sand (Bank Run) 300 250 |t_r 'S: 8) O

3 | 21A Limestone 500 100 #14.35

4 | 21AA Limestone 1,500 150 114 .40
5| 22A Natural 1,800 H jD.00
6 23 A Naturdl 400 1§ 10.00

- _ . o

L 34R (Peastone) 200 ’[‘T i')]7'3

8 4G Limestone 200 N O @'f CJ
9 || 6A Natural 1,500 & |5 l"'f
10 | 6A Limestone(3/4") 100 h i& 35

11 || 4A Limestone 1,000 No Rid
12 1" X 3" Limestone ' 400 b is 6S

2" x 4"1 Float :

13 L andlscape/Floa 400 j 2.

14 || 4" - 8" Rip Rap 100 1} Als s 0
15 3 X 1 Blast Furnace Slag 100 n 1<, 60

16 || Chloride-treated Sand 600 Ny @;d

ORDERING PROCEDURES:

Conlact person _,_;__ @ﬂm Q’\ rO o e

_FTeIephone humber an_:’i 6 ﬁ&j Qk{ LIE/ R T
Hours of Oherahon____e_:_g Q_f4m _]_\L._.;'LLQ.Q..%_.._.-_ S S
Minimum order quantity ____ () S




7
L
Materials will be delivered within c) [ hours after order Is called in.

DEVIATIONS/EXCEPTIONS:

Any suggested deviations from the specifications, terms and conditions shall be

provided in the space provided below, or on an attached summary sheet,

COMMENTS:

REFFERENCES: Please provide at least three client (3) references within the last 3 years:
Company __ gl% i) S}u’h})\:f Trucking )
Addres§ i 450 NO(T}h OL&\&T{X‘EIQ}'{“ [\4(’]: \'i 8‘3{3 !’.’
Phone 3-“8-%(3 -S197 Contact name 3 wli-7 Te Eha’{

company_Lokechor TS B
. 4 Fh vt Deve b S@ion

Address__ 1310 WQ()C‘ VaY )
— ™
Phone 5143 Is-41is Contacl name &!\nf‘lﬂ _ o

Company 805:” C,'_m{tr' (:,j-,“ ng
Address . |53 inbneh_(-'_‘fvﬁg; ff:_f’\;lﬁmf)} hi VP8
Phone #4531~ 201Lfl Contact name ,__Tﬁf?}f

Page 12 of 14



We acknowledge receipt of the following Addenda:

(please indicate numbers)

This bid is submitted by:

Company (Legal Reglstrqhon}\r“f‘\ 51 Tf 4 tfn“(j LL (,__

Address _BJL{ 9 F\_J“T’ (Dﬁ!m IO
City Ll‘R’i(J S state. ﬂi_ _lip__ ’ S’g 3[
telephone 24330 1~ QYUY rox ﬁ&dﬁfﬁii?i_*_

R0

Representative's Name (please print) an

Representalive's Tille __ ./\mew\}%' ~

Representative's Signature @W AAL L N ) TN :
E-mail hn E&-_s N\cILC,@\jkao T4
Dale 8 ‘bi“'H

Page 130l 14



CITY OF NOVI
AGGREGATE MATERIALS

Please return this page with your bid form

If your company is awarded the item(s) referenced in the bid proposal, other governmental
entities may wish to use this contract and will issue a purchase order or contract for the item(s)
awarded in the bid proposal following minimum order/contract requirements set forth in the bid
documents. Each entity will provide their own purchase order and delivery location(s) and must
be invoiced separately to the address indicated on their purchase order.

1. EXTENSION OF AWARD TO THE MITN (MICHIGAN INTER-GOVERNMENTAL TRADE NETWORK)
PURCHASING COOQOPERATIVE: OPTIONAL

Numerous Counlies, Cities, Townships, and Authorities of the State of Michigan are members of
the MITN (Michigan Inter-governmental Trade Network) Purchasing Cooperative. Olher
associate entities are also members of the Cooperalive in the Tri-County area. Please visit
www.miln.info website to view the enfire list of parficipating agencies.

~—— =l = ; i
() Ifan award is made to it‘l'r‘E-Q[ __f lfh(.»k?n;- L‘-C’, it is agreed that the contract will
be extended fo other MITN Purchasing Cooperdtive members and associate entities under the

same prices, terms, and condifions.

(") Our company is NOT interested in extending the contract to those MITN members listed on
thelwebsite.

Confractor Signature: __( o+ ’] W

Company Name: tb*‘idﬁ) —r”\uvL? 493 U.-Q.
Date: ___ ’{“ lk’[‘*‘] Lf }

Page 14 of 14
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