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CITY of NOVI CITY COUNCIL

Agenda Item G
May 9, 2011

SUBMITTING DEPARTMEN,a,C Safety

CITY MANAGER APPROV : .~

EXPENDITURE REQUIRED
p

Estimated $50,000-$60,000
AMOUNT BUDGETED $118,300 (Includes turn-out gear, cleaning and

other items
APPROPRIATION REQUIRED N/A
LINE ITEM NUMBER 101-301.00-741.000 and 101-337.00-741.000

SUBJECT: Approval to extend the 2010 Uniform Contract (an annual contract with two (2) one
year renewal options) with Allie Brothers, Inc. for the Police Department and add the Fire
Department uniforms to the contract for one year based on the same terms, conditions and
pricing as the original contract at an estimated amount of $50,000-$60,000.

~

BACKGROUND INFORMATION:

The City of Novi contracts for the purchase of uniforms for the Police and Fire Departments. In
early 2010 the City posted bid documents on the Michigan Intergovernmental Trade Network
(MITN) for Police and Fire uniforms and received three (3) bids. The contract was awarded in May
2010 to two firms based on unit pricing. Allie Brothers, Inc was awarded the contract for the
purchase of Police Department uniforms and North Eastern Uniforms and Equipment, Inc. was
awarded the contract for the purchase of Fire Department uniforms. The third bidder was
disqualified.

Over the past year, the Police Department has been pleased with the performance of Allie
Brothers and would like to pursue a renewal. Based on the unsatisfactory experience with North
Eastern Uniforms and Equipment over the past year it is the recommendation of staff not to
renew the contract with North Eastern Uniforms and Equipment. Allie Brothers, Inc. has expressed
their desire to renew the Police Department contract and to add the Fire Department contract
at the same prices, terms and conditions of their bid on March 10, 2010. Since the City only
received two qualified bids, and Allie Brothers, Inc. has agreed to hold pricing, City staff
recommends adding the Fire Department to the contract rather than separately bidding the Fire
Department contract, as there appears to be no cost benefit to rebidding the Fire Department
uniforms. The estimated increase in the Allie Brothers, Inc. contract to add the Fire Department is
$20,000.

RECOMMENDED ACTION: Approval to extend the 2010 Uniform Contract (an annual contract
with two (2) one year renewal options) with Allie Brothers, Inc. for the Police Department and add
the Fire Department uniforms to the contract for one year based on the same terms, conditions
and pricing as the original contract at an estimated amount of $50,000-$60,000.
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Mayor Pro Tem Gatt
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Council Member Maraolis
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Council Member Mutch
Council Member Staudt
Council Member Wrobel



Cauchi, Patricia

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Morianti, Sue
Wednesday, April 13, 2011 11 :31 AM
Cauchi, Patricia
FW: Police/Fire Bid

From: Bob Allie [mailto:rsallies@alliebros.com)
Sent: Wednesday, April 13, 201111:29 AM
To: Morianti, Sue
Subject: Police/Fire Bid

Hi Sue,

Allie Bros. Uniforms would like the opportunity to renew the Police Dept. contract and add the fire Dept.

contract both to the same terms and conditions from our bid on 3/10/10.

If you have any questions, please let me know.

Thank you,

Robert Allie

Allie Bros. Uniforms

248-477-4434
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CITY OF NOVI
UNIFORMS - POLICE & FIRE

SPECIFICATIONS
cityofnovi.org

SCOPE OF WORK
The City of Novi is seeking sealed proposals to provide Police and Fire Department uniforms.

TYPE OF CONTRACT
The contract period will be for one (1) year. Upon mutual consent of the City of Novi and the
successful bidder, the contract may be renewed two (2) times in one (1) year increments at the
same terms and conditions of the original contract.

ESTIMATED QUANTITIES
Police Department currently has 50 staff members who are supplied with uniforms. Fire
Department has 104 staff members who are supplied with uniforms. These numbers may
change during contract period.

New recruits are issued a set of uniform items and accessories according to their union
contract. In the spring and fall of each year, each department places an order for uniform items
needing replacements due to wear, damage, or fit problems. There may be additional smaller
orders throughout the year.

MEASURING
Measuring for all uniforms will be provided on-site at the Novi Police Department (45125 W. Ten
Mile Road, Novi MI 48375) and the Novi Fire Department Station #1 (42975 Grand River Ave.,
Novi MI). Vendor may be required to bring samples for sizing to the measurement appointment.
These appointments will be arranged by the departments.

TAILORING
Tailoring will be provided to ensure that the garments fit each employee properly. All additional
alteration and fitting costs will be born by the bidder. Bidder will make very effort to satisfy the
reasonable desires of each employee. Should a disagreement arise between the bidder and an
employee, the bidder agrees to settle the dispute in a manner which satisfies the City of Novi
designated employees. Successful bidder will be responsible for pick-up and delivery of the
items from the department if the problem is deemed to be the quality of tailoring.

DELIVERY
Uniforms will be delivered to the appropriate Department. Each item will be packaged and
clearly marked with the employee to whom it belongs.

Delivery of uniform items is expected within 14 working days. The successful bidder must
immediately notify the appropriate department if extraordinary circumstances cause extended
delivery time. Failure by the supplier to deliver within the stated time may result in termination of
the contract.
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FREIGHT/ DELIVERY CHARGES
All delivery and/or freight charges are to be included in the unit pricing of the bid items. All bid
pricing is to be quoted as F.O. B. delivered.

INSURANCE
A certificate of insurance naming the City of Novi as an additional insured must be provided by the
successful bidder prior to commencement of work. A current certificate of insurance meeting the
requirements in Attachment A is to be provided to the City and remain in force during the entire
contract period.

TAX EXEMPTION
It is understood that the City of Novi is a governmental unit, and as such, is exempt from the
payment of all Michigan State Sales and Federal Excise taxes. Do not include such taxes in the
bid prices. The City will furnish the successful bidder with tax exemption certificates when
requested. The City's tax-exempt number is 38-6032551.

PAYMENTS / TERMS
Invoices will be submitted to the Finance Department after uniforms have been delivered. The
invoice will be processed and every effort will be made to make payment within 30 days.
Problems with an order or an incorrect invoice may cause a delayed payment. If contractor
requires pre-payment or deposit, this must be clearly specified on proposal form and will be
taken into consideration when evaluating the bids.

REFERENCES
Please include a list of references from 3 municipalities (not including the City of Novi) for which
you have provided this service within the last 3 years. Include entity name, address, contact
person and contact phone number.
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CITY OF NOVI
BID TABULATION

UNIFORMS - FIRE DEPARTMENT

BID DUE 3/11/10

North Eastern
Brand/Model # Additonal description Allie Brothers Uniform Priority One*

SHIRTS/JACKETS

** Long Sleeve Shirt 65% poly/35% cotton with Nano
(Navy) Elbeco G974 Tex 38.99 35.00 49.99 *
** Short Sleeve Shirt 65% poly/35% cotton with Nano
(Navy) Elbeco G964 Tex 36.50 32.00 49.99 *
** Long Sleeve Shirt 65% poly/35% cotton with Nano
(Lt. Blue) Elbeco P878 Tex 29.99 30.00 49.99 *
** Short Sleeve Shirt 65% poly/35% cotton with Nano
(Lt. Blue) Elbeco P868 Tex 28.99 26.00 49.99 *
** Long Sleeve Shirt
(White) Elbeco 310 100% poly TexTrop 32.99 30.00 No Bid
** Short Sleeve Shirt
(White) Elbeco 3310 100% poly TexTrop 30.99 29.00 No Bid

with silkscreened logo as specified by Fire Dept.&

Job Shirt (Navy) Game #811 embroidered name 49.99 48.00 69.99 *
** Dress Blouse Class A double-breasted, 55%
(Navy) Elbeco #13750 poly/45% wool 199.99 169.00 No Bid

Fruit of the Loom
100% colton, with silkscreened logo as specified by Fire

T-Shirt Heavy Dept. (Minimum of 12 to be ordered at one time) 12.00 9.00 6.99 *
** Sweater (Navy) Blauer #205 49.95 49.00 No Bid
** Jacket (Navy) Blauer #901 OZ 249.95 239.00 No Bid
PANTS
Uniform Pants 65% poly/35% cotton with Nano
(Navy) Elbeco E814 Tex 37.99 39.00 49.99 *

65% poly/35% cotton with
Cargo Pants (Navy) Elbaco E614 TekTwili 54.99 49.00 49.99 *
Dress Trouser
(Navy) Elbeco E1360 Class A, 55% polyester/45% wool 64.99 62.00 No Bid

Red Cap #CT1 ONV
Wit I ;:'co C I e on 5 eeves ano anKles ana aown e ron,

44.50 40.00 99.99 ***Coveralls (Navy) silkscreened logo as specified by Fire Dept.

HATS
Fire Cap (Navy) Hankin Bros #5-1-1 Serge 36.99 35.00 No Bid

wool, with embroidered logo as specified
Ball Cap (Navy) Broder Flexfit #6477 by Fire Dept. 10.99 13.00 9.99 *

Broner Super with embroidered logo as
Watch Cap (Black) Stretch specified by Fire Dept. 6.99 8.00 12.99 *
MISCELLANEOUS

**Price to include badge tab and supplier is to sew on
two (2) Fire Department furnished shoulder patches. Page 1 of 2



CITY OF NOVI
BID TABULATION

UNIFORMS - FIRE DEPARTMENT

BID DUE 3/11/10

North Eastern
Brand/Model # Additonal description Allie Brothers Uniform Priority One*

Hat Badge (Nickel) Blackinton # B500 31.99 31.00 22.62
Uniform Tie (Black) Samuel Broome Wool, clip-on 3.99 4.00 No Bid

BIW Fire Belt (Black) Tex Shoemaker 22.99 18.00 No Bid
Uniform Badge 32.00 silver, 33.00
(Silver and/or Gold) Blackinton #B1009 42.00 38.00 gold

Uniform Collar Insignia with white, red, blue center; round
(Silver and/or Gold) #A6981 Captain with 2 horns 9.99 17.50/pr 9.15

Uniform Collar Insignia with white, red, blue center, round
(Silver and/or Gold) #A6985 Lieutenant with 1 horn blank 17.50/pr 9.15
OVERSIZE
Work Pant (Navy) sizes 48 & up N/C plus $5.00
**Short Sleeve Shirt XXL N/C plus $5.00
**Short Sleeve Shirt XXXL plus 10% 10% plus $5.00
**Long Sleeve Shirt XXL N/C plus $5.00
**Long Sleeve Shirt XXXL plus 10% 10% plus $5.00
T-Shirt XXL N/C plus $5.00
T-Shirt XXXL plus 10% 10% plus $5.00
**Coveralls 50/52 N/C plus $5.00
**Coveralls 54/56 10% plus $5.00
**Coveralls 58/60 plus 10% 20.00 plus $5.00
**Jacket Size 50 - 52 N/C plus $5.00
**Jacket Size 54 & up 10.00 plus $5.00
ALTERATIONS
Pants 10.00
Shirts Normal alterations no 10.00
Jacket charge 10.00
Coverall 10.00
Jacket Striping 8.00 per row 10.00
Jacket Stars .50 each 10.00

* Priority One disqualified for not bidding on all items.

**Price to include badge tab and supplier is to sew on
two (2) Fire Department furnished shoulder patches. Page 2 of 2



CITY OF NOVI
BID TABULATION

UNIFORMS - POLICE

BID DUE 3/11/10

Brand / Model # Additional Descriotion Allie Brothers North Eastern Uniform Priority One *
Shirts

* Long Sleeve -
Elbeco Duty Max #544 11 3/4 oz Gabardine w/Nano Tex (Navy) 40.50 42.95 54.99 *Winter

* Short Sleeve - Elbeco Tex Trop
Dacron Polyester wlNano Tex (Navy) 34.95 32.00 49.99 *Summer #3314

* Long Sleeve -
Elbeco Duty Max #544 11 3/4 oz Gabardine wlNano Tex (White) 35.95 38.95 49.99 *Winter Command

* Short Sleeve - Elbeco Tex Trop
Dacron Polyester wlNano Tex (White) 31.95 31.50 49.99 *Winter Command #3314

* Fatigue Shirt Elbeco #9204 Navy 34.95 33.95 44.99 *

Mock Turtleneck Elbeco #8924
Uflx Performance, black wlNOVI PD

34.95 36.00 44.99 *embroidered in white
Dickie Blauer #81 09X Black, wi NOVI PD embroidered in white 13.50 12.95 No Bid

* K-9 Shirt Elbeco #9204 Navy, Additional patch to be sewn on left chest, no badge tab 34.95 35.45 49.99 *
Pants

Midweight Pant - Elbeco #E254N Navy, male and female sizes, pockets - 2 side, 2 hip, 1 watch, 2
64.99 74.00 59.99 *Summer & Winter #9254N side sap, plain botUom w/3" hem, 1" black ribbed stripe

Fatigue Pant Elbeco #E7604 Navy 34.95 33.60 39.99 *
K-9 Pant Elbeco #E7604 Navy 34.95 33.60 39.99 *

Gun Pocket To be added to pants as requested 6.00 9.00 9.99 *
Neckties
Clip on Regular Length Navy, 75% Polyester 125% Wool 3.95 4.00 No Bid
Clip on Long Length Navy, 75% Polyester 125% Wool 3.95 4.00 No Bid

Hand Tied Navy, 75% Polyester 125% Wool 3.95 4.00 No Bid
Headgear

Uniform Hat - Dress
Lancaster Company -

Center Post Hole 44.95 39.95 No BidPershing
Command Uniform Lancaster Company - Center Post Hole with gold "scrambled egg" on bill for Asst Chief,

64.95 69.95 No BidHat - Dress Pershing Dep Chief and Chief

Hat Cover Blauer#107 Reversible urethane coated nylon, (Yellow) 9.95 8.00 No Bid

Trooper Hat - Winter Albaum Navy, Center Post Hole 18.95 15.95 No Bid

Baseball Cap Flexfit
Navy, wi Embroidered Novi PD patch sewn

9.95 9.95 9.99 *
on

Knit Watch Cap Broner #61-161
Black, wi Embroidered Novi PD patch sewn

7.95 6.50 9.99 *on
Outerwear

* All Weather Jacket Blauer #901 OZ Epaulets & badge tab, Gore-Tex lined, removable Thinsulate liner,
249.95 239.00 229.99 *concealable refiective strips on collar & cuffs

* Price to include badge tab and supplier to sew on
two (2) Police Department furnished shoulder patches. Page 1 of 4



CITY OF NOVI
BID TABULATION

UNIFORMS - POLICE

BID DUE 3/11/10

Brand / Model # Additional Description Allie Brothers North Eastern Uniform Priority One *

FTO Jacket Blauer #330
wlconcealable "Police" banner on back and

29.95 35.00 54.99 *
chest

Raincoat
Blauer Defender All Yellow, full length, wI scotchlight reflective

79.95 78.50 129.99 *
#26990 striping

* Sweater
Blauer Commando 100% Wool, Badge tabs and name tab sewn

54.95 49.00 No Bid
#200 on

Footwear
Shoes Bates Low-quarter, leather, rubber sole 55.00 50.00 84.99 *

Galoshes wI center front zipper 29.95 32.00 No Bid
Motorcycle

* Shirt Olympic Coolmax Navy, Short Sleeve 54.99 69.50 No Bid

Riding Breeches -
Fleichheimer Flying
Cross LAPD Specs Navy 169.99 219.00 No Bid

Cool Weather
#RN28562

Riding Breeches -
United Uniform Navy, 100% Polyester, Police Riding Pant 99.99 125.00 No Bid

Warm Weather

* Leather Jacket Taylor
Black, Leather wlepaulets, badge holder,

329.99 399.00 No Bid
removable liner, Detroit style

Cycle Boots Dehners #34926
Black, Leather, 9 hole lace at Instep, single

389.99 399.00 No Bid
buckle calf, rubber sole

Rain Jacket Dry Rider #475MD wlScotchlight reflective stripe 49.99 49.00 No Bid
Rain Pants Dry Rider #475 wlScotchlight reflective stripe 39.99 39.00 No Bid

Gloves Olympia - Roper I 35.99 32.50 No Bid
Goggles Wiley X "Raptor" 84.99 59.00 No Bid
Helmet 269.95 249.00 No Bid

Bike Uniform

Royall Navy Scotchlite stripe on Sleeve and chest, 3 1/4" X 9 1/4"

Shirt Blauer#8132P Scotchlite "POLICE" on back, Badge patch on left chest Zippered 54.95 47.95 No Bid
pocket wlpen holders, police patches on both sleeves

Shorts Blauer #8842 Navy 49.99 47.50 No Bid
Sweatpants Blauer #8822 Navy 59.99 59.00 No Bid

Royall Navy Scotchlite stripe on Sleeve and chest, 3 1/4" X 91/4"

Jacket Blauer #4660P Scotchlite "POLICE" on back, Badge patch on left chest Zippered 113.99 109.00 No Bid
pocket wlpen holders, police patches on both sleeves

Shoes
New Balance Bike

Black 79.95 75.00 No Bid
Shoes #706

Leather Gear

Garrison Belt Bianchi #B8 11 3/4 oz basket weave wNelcro for Officers and with gold buckle 22.95 32.00 13.90 **
for Lieutenants, Asst Chief, DeDutv Chief and Chief

Sam Browne Belt Bianchi #B2 21/4', fully lined, basket weave 54.95 59.00 32.25 **
Weapon Holster Safariland #20050 For Glock 22 & 23, security level II 114.99 99.50 96.47

* Price to include badge tab and supplier to sew on
two (2) Police Department furnished shoulder patches. Page 2 of4



CITY OF NOVI
BID TABULATION

UNIFORMS - POLICE

BID DUE 3/11/10

Brand / Model # Additional Description Allie Brothers North Eastern Uniform Priority One *

11 3/4 oz basket weave, silver snap for Officers / Sergeants Gold
15.81 (substituted

Cuff Case Bianchi #35P 32.95 29.95 basic cuff case withfor lieuteants, Asst Chief, Deputy Chief and Chief

snaps)
Chemical Spray Boston Leather #5535-

Basket weave for Freeze +P spray 13.99 16.50 11.39Carrier 3

Flashlight Holder
Boston Leather #5576-

Basket weave for Pelican flashlight 16.99 18.95 14.173
ASP Holder Safariland #35 Basket weave 27.50 22.50 22.89

Magazine Carrier Safariland #77-83-4HS Basket weave, double with snaps 32.99 29.95 29.59

Belt Keepers Boston Leather Basket weave 1.99 2.00 2.07

Off Duty Holster
Don Hume #H721-P-

Non-Basket weave for Glock 22 & 23 48.00 47.50 57.0036
Belt Badge Holder Boston Leather Die-Cut for badge B-51 12.50 9.95 10.50

Neck Badge Holder Perfect Fit #706 With Chain 10.99 9.50 9.81 **

Badge Case Strong #B251 Leather 21.99 16.50 14.22 **
Magazine 1Cuff

Safari land #2601 Plain or Basket weave 44.99 39.95 32.05Holder
Equipment

Handcuffs Peerless Standard, Chain 28.99 28.50 16.16
ASP Baton ASP 21" Collapsible 59.50 57.95 44.64

Riot Helmet
Premier Crown PC-

With Shield and Neck Protector FXR 125.00 135.00 122.676006
Riot Baton Wood,3' 14.99 17.50 No Bid
Flashlight Pelican #7060 LED Flashlight 119.99 109.00 21.29

Traffic Vest Galls #HS279 ANSI/ISEA 207-2006 standard 19.99 29.95 9.95 (substituted Galls)

Clipboard Saunders #10003 83/4" x 14" Aluminum 28.99 27.50 15.02
Ticket Book Holder Saunders #12205 5" x 12" Aluminum 22.00 22.00 30.42

Binoculars Bushnell 10x50 Insta-Focus 29.99 49.50 No Bid
Range Glasses Silencio Clear Lens 8.99 9.00 No Bid

Gloves Franklin #17310 Textured, leather palm/fingers, leather & mesh back, cut-resistant
44.99 45.00 34.69(soectra, arimid or Kevlar) lined

Accessories I Brass

Shirt Badge Blackinton B251
Silver - Officers I Sergeants Gold -

46.99 45.00
32.15 Silver,

Command 39.75 Gold

Jacket Badge Blackinton B562
Silver - Officers 1Sergeants Gold -

46.99 45.00
32.15 Silver,

Command 39.75 Gold

Hat Badge Blackinton B616
Silver - Officers I Sergeants Gold -

39.99 35.00
36.97 Silver,

* ..... Command 39.75 Gold
'''''' 'v " IUU" uou~" ,ou 0' IU 'v ~'" VI

two (2) Police Department furnished shoulder patches. Page 3 of4



CITY OF NOVI
BID TABULATION

UNIFORMS - POLICE

BID DUE 3/11/10

* Pnonty One disqualified for not bidding on all Items.

Brand 1Model # Additional Description Allie Brothers North Eastern Uniform Priority One *

Wallet Badge Blackinton B251 Flat
Silver - Officers / Sergeants Gold -

46.99 45.00
32.15 Silver,

Command 39.75 Gold

Name Plate Blackinton A2388
Silver - Officers / Sergeants Gold -

10.25 9.00 9.95Command Black Letters, Pin & Clasp Back

Tie Bar Blackinton Silver - Officers I Sergeants Gold - Command State 10.99 12.00 13.00Seal wl"Novi Police" enoraved

Collar VI Blackinton Silver - Custom made "VI" 9.99 9.00 12.80/pr
Collar Rank Insignia

Blackinton Chevron. 3 Stripes 4.00 4.00 10.00/prSergeant

Collar Rank Insignia
Blackinton A1973 Gold bar, Flat finish 4.00 6.00 8.77/prLieutenant

Collar Rank Insignia
Blackinton A3731 2 Gold Stars 12.99 8.00 9.86/prAsst. Chief

Collar Rank Insignia
Blackinton A3731 3 Gold Stars 13.99 8.00 10.19/prDeputy Chief

Collar Rank Insignia
Blackinton A3731 4 Gold Stars 14.99 8.00 11.06/prChief

Coat Epaulet Rank
Blackinton A1973 Gold bar, Flat finish 6.00 6.00 8.77/prInsignia - Lieutenant

Coat Epaulet Rank
Blackinton A3731 2 Gold Stars 12.99 8.00 9.86/prInsignia - Asst. Chief

Coat Epaulet Rank
Insignia - Deputy Blackinton A3731 3 Gold Stars 13.99 8.00 10.19/pr

Chief
Coat Epaulet Rank

Blackinton A3731 4 Gold Stars 14.99 8.00 11.06/prInsignia - Chief

Whistle Acme Thunderer Silver - Officers I Sergeants Gold - Command
4.00 4.00 No BidWfTooth Protector

Whistle Chain Blackinton V313
Silver - Officers / Sergeants Gold -

4.00 4.00 11.50 silver, 11.99 goldCommand

Hat Bands Blackinton V298
Black - Officers Silver - Sergeant, Gold -

8.50 8.00 9.70Command
Provide on-site measuring? Yes Yes Yes

Blauer jacket #330 is no longer a
Comments/Exceptions stock item. Comparable jacket

quoted
..

* Price to include badge tab and supplier to sew on
two (2) Police Department furnished shoulder patches. Page 4 of4



CITY OF NOVI
BID FORM - POLICE DEPARTMENT UNIFORMS

We the undersigned as bidder, propose to furnish to the City of Novi, according to the conditions &
Instructions attached hereto and made a part thereof for the following price:

cityofnovi.org

-

Uniform Hat - Dress
Lancaster Company

Center Post Hole
Pershing 44.95

Command Uniform Hat - Lancaster Company Center Post Hole with gold "scrambled egg"
Dress Pershing on bill for Asst Chief, Dep Chief and Chief 64.95

Hat Cover Blauer #1 07 Reversible urethane coated nylon, (Yellow) 9.95

Trooper Hat - Winter Albaum Navy, Center Post Hole 18.95

Baseball Cap Flexfit
Navy, wI Embroidered N-ovi PD patch sewn

9.95
on

Knit Watch Cap Broner #61-161
Black: wI Embroidered Novi PD patch sewn

on 7.95

* Long Sleeve - Winter
ElbecoDuly MaX

11 3/4 02 Gabardine w/Nano Tex (Navy) 40.50#544

* Short Sleeve - Summer
Elbeco Tex Trop

Dacron Polyester w/Nano Tex (Navy)
#3314 34.95

* Long Sleeve - Winter Elbeco-Duty Max
11 3/40z Gabardine w/Nano Tex (White)

Command #544 35.95
* Short Sleeve - Winter EI~eco Tex Trop

Dacron Polyester w/Nano Tex (White)
Command #3314 31.95

* Fatigue Shirt Elbeco #9204 Navy 34.95

Mock Turtleneck Elbeco #8924
Uf/x Performance, black w/NOVI PD

embroidered in white 34.95

Dickie Blauer #81 09X Black, wi NOVI PD embroidered in white 13.50

* K-9 Shirt Elbeco #9204
Navy, Additional patch to be sewn on left

chest, no bad e tab

Midweight Pant - Elbeco #E254N
Navy, male and female sizes, pockets - 2

side, 2 hip, 1 watch, 2 side sap, plain boUtom
Summer & Winter #9254N

w/3" hem, 1" black ribbed strl e 64.99

Fatigue Pant Elbeco #E7604 Navy 34.95

K-9 Pant Elbeco #E7604 Navy 34.95

Gun Pocket To be added to pants as requested 6.00

* Price to include badge tab and supplier to sew on
two (2) Police Department furnished shoulder patches.
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* All Weather Jacket Blauer #901 OZ
Epaulets

removable Thlnsulate liner, concealable
reflective stri s on collar & cuffs 249.95

FTO Jacket
w/concealable "Police" banner on back and

Blauer #330 chest 29.95

Raincoat
Blauer Defender All Yellow, full length, wI scotchlight reflectiv

#26990 stri in
Blauer Commando - 100% Wool, Badge tabs and name tab sewn

#200 on

79.95

* Shirt Olympic Coolmax Navy, Short Sleeve 54.99

Riding Breeches ~ Cool
Fleichheimer Flying
Cross LAPD Specs Navy

Weather
#RN28562 169.99

Riding Breeches ~ Warm
- .

Weather
United Uniform Navy, 100% Polyester, Police Riding Pant 99.99

* Leather Jacket Taylor
Black, Leather wlepaulets, badge holder,

removable liner, Detroit st Ie 329.99

Cycle Boots Dehners #34926
Black; Leather,9 hole lace at Instep, single

buckle calf, rubber sale 389.99

Rain Jacket Dry Rider#475MD wlScotchlight reflective stripe 49.99
Rain Pants Dry Rider #475 w/Scotchlight reflective stripe 39.99

Gloves Olympia - Roper I 35.99

Goggles Wiley X "Raptor" 84.99
._.

Helmet 269.95

Royall Navy Scotchlits stripe on Sleeve
and chest, 3 1/4" X 9 1/4" Scotchlite

Shirt Blauer #8132P "POLICE" on back, Badge patch on left
chest Zippered pocket wlpen holders, police

atches on both sleeves 54.95

Shorts Blauer #8842 Navy 49.99
Sweatpants Blauer #8822 Navy 59.99

Royall Navy Scotchlite stripe on Sleeve

I and chest, 3 1/4" X 9 1/4" Scotchlite
Jacket Blauer #4660P "POLICE" on back, Badge patch on left

chest Zippered pocket wlpen holders, police
atches on both sleeves 113.99

Shoes
New Balance Bike

Black
Shoes #706 79.95

11 3/4 oz basket weave wNelcrotor Officers
Garrison Belt Bianchi #B8 and with gold buckle for Lieutenants, Asst

Chief, Deputy Chief and Chief 22.95

Sam Browne Belt Bianchi #B2 2 1/4', fully lined, basket weave 54.95

* Price to include badge tab and supplier to sew on
two (2) Police Department furnished shoulder patches.
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Weapon Holster

Cuff Case

Chemical Spray Carrier

Flashlight Holder

ASP Holder

Magazine Carrier

Belt Keepers

Off Duty Holster

Belt Badge Holder

Neck Badge Holder

Badge Case

Magazine / Cuff Holder

Safari land #20050

Bianchi #35P

Boston Leather
#5535-3

Boston Leather
#5576-3

Safari land #35

Safariland #77-83­
4HS

Boston Leather

Don Hume #H721-P­
36

Boston Leather

Perfect Fit #706

Strong #B251

Safariland #2601

For Glock 22 & 23, security level II

11 3/4 oz basket weave, silver snap for
Officers / Sergeants Gold for Iieuteants,

Asst Chief, De ut Chief and Chief

Basket weave for Freeze +P spray

Basket weave for Pelican flashlight

Basket weave

Basket weave, double with snaps

Basket weave

Non~Basket weave for Glock 22 & 23

Die-Cut for badge B-51

With Chain

Leather

Plain or Basket weave

114.99

32.95

13.99

16.99

27.50

32.99

1. 99

48.00

12.50

10.99

21.99

44.99

Handcuffs

ASP Baton

Riot Helmet

Riot Baton

Flashlight

Traffic Vest

Clipboard

Ticket Book Holder

Binoculars

Range Glasses

Gloves

c,~Q:g~i~qf~I$~i~~i.j

Shirt Badge

Jacket Badge

Hat Badge

Wallet Badge

Peerless

ASP

Premier Crown
PC-6006

Pelican #7060

Galls#HS279

Saunders #10003

Saunders #12205

Bushnell

Silencio

Franklin #17310

Blackinton B251

Blackinton B562

Blackinton B616

Blackinton B251 Flat

Standard, Chain

21" Collapsible

,With Shield and Neck Protector FXR

Wood,3'

LED Flashlight

ANSI/ISEA 207-2006 standard

83/4" X 14" Aluminum

5" x 12" Aluminum

1Ox50 Insta-Focus

Clear Lens

Textured, leather palm/fingers, leather &
mesh back, cut-resistant (spectra, arimid, or

Kevlar) lined

Silver - Officers / Sergeants
Gold - Command

Silver - Officers / Sergeants
Gold - Command

Silver - Officers / Sergeants
Gold - Command

Silver - Officers / Sergeants
Gold· Command

28.99

59.50

125.00

14.99

119.99

19.99

28.99

22.00

29.99

8.99

44.99

46.99

46.99

39.99

46.99

Name Plate Blackinton A2388 Silver - Officers / Sergeants Gold -
Command Black Letters, Pin & Clasp Back 10.25

Tie Bar Blackinton
Silver - Officers / Sergeants

Gold - Command State Seal w/"Novi
Police" engraved 10.99

* Price to include badge tab and supplier to sew on
two (2) Police Department furnished shoulder patches.
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Collar VI Blackinton Silver - Custom made "VI" 9.99

Collar Rank Insignia - Blackinton
Ser eant

Chevron. 3 Stripes 4.00

Collar Rank Insignia - Blackinton A1973
Lieutenant

Gold bar, Flat finish 4.00

Collar Rank Insignia - Blackinton A3731
Asst. Chief

2 Gold Stars 12.99

Collar Rank Insignia - Blackinton A3731
De ut Chief

3 Gold Stars 13.99

Collar Rank Insignia - Blackinton A3731
Chief

4 Gold Stars 14.99

Coat Epaulet Rank Blackinton A1973
Insl nla - Lieutenant

Gold bar, Flat finish 6.00

Coat Epaulet Rank Blackinton A3731
Insi nia - Asst. Chief

2 Gold Stars 12.99

Coat Epaulet Rank Blackinton A3731
Insi nia - De u Chief

3 Gold Stars 13.99

Coat Epaulet Rank Blackinton A3731
Insi nia - Chief

Whistle Acme Thunderer

4 Gold Stars

Silver - Officers / Sergeants
Gold - Command WlTooth Protector

14.99

4.00

Whistle Chain Blackinton V313
Silver~-Officers I Sergeants

Gold - Command 4.00

Hat Bands Blackinton V298
Black - Offlc-ers Silver - Sergeants

Gold - Command 8.50

NoYesx

N/AWe acknowledge the following addendums: _--.:- _

Bid prices Include on-site measuring services:

References are attached: X Yes No

Exceptions to specifications/Comments:

Company name

Address

City, State Zip

Phone

Fax

Agents Name

Agents Signature

Date

ALLIE BROS. INC

20295 MIDDLEBELT RD.

LIVONIA, MI. 48152

248 477-4434

248-477-1416

ROBERT ALLIE

3-10-10

* Price to include badge tab and supplier to sew on
two (2) Police Department furnished shoulder patches.
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We the undersigned as bidder, propose to furnish to the City of Novi, according to the conditions &

instructions attached hereto and made a part thereof for the fol/owing price:

CITY OF NOVI
BID FORM" FIRE DEPARTMENT UNIFORMS

38.9965% 01y/35% cotton with Nano TexElbeco G974

SHIRTS/JACKETS
** Long Sleeve Shirt
Navy)

** Long Sleeve Shirt (Lt.
Blue) Elbeco P878
** Short Sleeve Shirt (Lt.
Blue) Elbeco P868

** Short Sleeve Shirt
(Navy) Elbeco G964

**-Long Sleeve Shirt
White)

30.99

32.99

28.99

36.50

29.99

100% poly TexTrop

65% pol /35% cotton with Nano Tex

65% poly/35% cotton with Nano Tex

100% poly TexTrop

65% poly/35% cotton with Nano Tex

Elbeco 310
Sleeve Shirt

Elbeco 3310
** Short
(White)

Job Shirt (Navy) Game#811
with silkscreened logo as specified by
Fire De t.& embroidered name 49.99

** Dress Blouse (Navy Elbeco #13750
Class A double-breasted, 55% poly/45%
wool 199.99

Fruit of the Loom
T-Shirt Heavy

100,% cotton, with silkscreened logo as
specified by Fire Dept. (Minimum of 12 to
be ordered at one time) 12.00

** Sweater (Navy Blauer #205 49.95

249.95

65% poly/35% cotton with Nano Tex

65% oly/35% cotton with TekTwill

Elbeco E814

Elbaco E614Cargo Pants (Navy)

Uniform Pants (Na )

I-=**~J...,...a:=c~ke...:..t..l..(N_a...:..v~Y)__~Blauer#901 OZ
PANTS

Dress Trouser Navy) Elbeco E1360 Class A, 55% polyester/45% wool 64.99

**Coveralls (Navy)
HATS -

Fire Ca Navy)

with Scotchlite on sleeves and ankles and
down the front, silkscreened logo as
s ecified Fire

Hankin Bros #5-1-1 Serge

44.50

36.99

Ball Ca Navy)
wool, with embroidered logo as specified

Broder Flexfit #6477 by Fire Dept. 10.99

Watch Cap (Black)
MISCELLANEOUS

with embroidered logo as specified by
Stretch Fire

Hat Badge (Nicl<el) Blackinton # B500 31.99

Uniform Tie Black) Samuel Broome Wool, clip-on 3.99

BIW Fire Belt Black)
Uniform Badge (Silver
and/or Gold)

Tex Shoemaker

Blackinton #B 1009

22.99

42.00
Uniform Collar Insignia
(Silver and/or Gold) #A6981 Captain

with white, red, blue center; round with 2
horns 9.99

** Price to include badge tab and supplier is to sew on
two (2) Fire Department furnished shoulder patches.
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Brand/Model #
Uniform Collar InSignia
Silver and/or Gold) #A6985 Lieutenant

OVERSIZE

Work Pant (Nav

Additonal description
with white, red, blue center, round with 1
horn

Unit Price

**Short Sleeve Shirt

**Short Sleeve Shirt

**Long Sleeve Shirt

**Long Sleeve Shirt

T-Shirt

**Coveralls

**Coveralls

**Coveralls

**Jacket

**Jacket
ALTERATIONS

Pants

Shirts

Jacket

Coverall

Jacket Striping

Jacket Stars

XXL
XXXL
XXL
XXXL
XXL
XXXL
50/52

54/56

58/60

Size 50 - 52

ADD 10%

ADD 10%

ADD 10%

ADD 10%

We acknowledge the following addendums: _~N~/~A_~ _

Bid prices includes on-site measuring services: x Yes No

References are attached: X Yes No

Exceptions to Specifications I Comments:

Company name

Address

City, State Zip

Phone

Fax

Agents Name

Agents Signature

Date

ALLIE BROS. INC

20295 MIDDLEBELT RD.
LIVONIA, MICHIGAN 48152

248-477-4434

248-477-1416

-10-10

** Price to include badge tab and supplier is to sew on
two (2) Fire Department furnished shoulder patches.
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