ClLY OF

CITY of NOVI CITY COUNCIL

Agenda Item 1
March 3, 2008

cityolnovi.org

SUBJECT: Consideration of Ordinance No. 08-99.14, an amendment to Chapter 15, Fire Prevention, of
the City's Code of Ordinances, in order to adopt the 2006 International Fire Code, as
amended, as the City’s Fire Prevention Code. First Reading

SUBMITTING DEPARTMENT: Fire

CITY MANAGER APPROVAL%{

BACKGROUND INFORMATION:

The current Fire Code used by the City of Novi is the 2000 International Fire Code (IFC) as
amended by Chapter 15 of the Novi Code of Ordinances. This revision to the 2006 IFC would
adopt the most up-to-date model fire code. The International Fire Code is the sister code to
Michigan’s adopted Building, Plumbing and Mechanical codes. The |FC is used and referenced in
Michigan's adopted Building, Plumbing and Mechanical codes.

This proposed Fire Ordinance amendment also revises several paragraphs in the Open Burning
Section of the current ordinance to match the language in Section 307, Open Burning and
Recreational Fires, of the 2006 IFC. There are no substantial code changes being proposed with
this adoption.

RECOMMENDED ACTION: Consideration of Ordinance No. 08-99.14, an amendment to Chapter
15, Fire Prevention, of the City's Code of Ordinances, in order to adopt the 2006 International Fire
Code, as amended, as the City's Fire Prevention Code. First Reading

1]2[Y] N| 1[2]Y]N]
Mayor Landry Council Member Margolis ) | '
Mayor Pro Tem Capello | Council Member Mutch . |
Council Member Crawford Council Member Staudt
Council Member Gatt




CTTY - OT

= o I
S
| o

8 %
- i

cityofnovi.org

ke

TO: CLAY PEARSON, CITY MANAGER
FROM:  FRANKA. SMITH, FIRE CHIEF ¢5~
SUBJECT: 2006 IFC ADOPTION
DATE:  FEBRUARY 27, 2008

i
st Y b

| recommend that the City of Novi adopt the 2006 Intemational Fire Code. This would replace the

2000 IFC that is currently adopted and enforced.

There are minimal changes in the 2006 IFC different from the 2000 IFC that would have any

impact on the business community and the noteworthy changes are listed below:

2006 International Fire Code changes:

Chapter 1: Code intent is to provide safety to fire fighters and other responders

Chapter 1: Clarifies language that prohibits the overcrowding of any establishment

Chapter 3: Allows for the placarding of dangerous buildings to prevent entry by first
responders

Chapter 4: Requires High-Rise buildings to have annual fire drills

Chapter 6: Provides minimum safety requirements for portable electric heaters

Chapter 22; Motor Fuel Dispensing Facilities: the code now includes Hydrogen Fuel

Chapter 27: Recognizes Performance Based Design for the storage, use and handling of

hazardous materials

| believe that the adoption of the 2006 International Fire Code will allow the City of Novi to remain at

the “cutting edge” of fire inspection and enforcement.



Ordinance No. 08-99.14

STRIKE-OUT VERSION




CITY OF NOVI1
COUNTY OF OAKLAND
STATE OF MICHIGAN
ORDINANCE NO. 08-99.14
AN ORDINANCE TO AMEND CHAPTER 15 OF THE CITY CODE OF

ORDINANCES TO ADOPT THE INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE, 2006
EDITION, BY REFERENCE WITH CERTAIN AMENDMENTS

THE CITY OF NOVI ORDAINS:

Part 1

Article 11, Fire Prevention Code, in Chapter 15, Fire Prevention, of the City of Novi Code of
Ordinances, is hereby amended to read as follows:

ARTICLE II. FIRE PREVENTION CODE
Sec. 15-16. International Fire Prevention Code — Adopted; amended; insertions

tar—AH-provisieonsolthednternational-Fire revention Code 2000as-prepared-by-the
Internationalb Code Counctbtneexeept-lor-Subrections405 08 40U 2 - Sector-307
Stbrection-3032-are-hereby adoptedcenacted asthe Novi Fire Prevention Codes and mrade
partotthisarticke by reberence

h—tHeseresulattonsshat-bedownws-the-Fre Prevention Code-of the Lol Novk:
heveiptiler referred toas “this code™

ter—theciytHrechitetis-herebydesignated-asthe-code olticia-Hor purposes- ol thisartiele:

The International Fire Code, 2006 Edition, including the Appendix Chapters, as

promulgated and published by the International Code Council and except as amended

herein is hereby adopted by reference as an Ordinance and Fire Code for the City of Novi,

regulating and governing the safeguarding of life and property from fire and explosion

hazards arising from the storage, handling and use of hazardous substances, materials and

devices, and from conditions hazardous to life or property in the occupancy of buildings

and premises as herein provided; providing for the issuance of permits and collection of

fees therefore, and each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and

terms of said Fire Code on file in the Office of the Novi City Clerk are hereby referred fo,




| adopted and made a part hereof, as if fully set out in this Ordinance, with the amendments
and insertions, and subject to the limitations, in the remaining Sections of this Article.

The following sections of the Fire Code are amended fo insert the information indicated.

Section 101.1 Insert “City of Novi.”

Section 109.3 Insert “S$500 and/or 90 days in jail.”

Section 111.4 Insert “$250 up to $500.”

Sec. 15-17. Amendments.

The Fire Code adopted by reference in section 15-16 is hereby amended in the following
respects:

Subsection 105.1.1. Permits required, shall be amended to read as follows:

Permits are required for the various uses and activities as provided in this code, except in
instances where the use or activity is conducted pursuant to a permit issued by the building
department under the state construction code, as enforced by the city. Permits required under
this code shall be obtained from the code official. Permits shall at all times be kept on the
premises designated therein and shall at all times be subject to inspection by the code official.
Inspections of work and materials for which a permit was obtained shall be made as required by
the authority having jurisdiction or the duly authorized representative.

Subsection 108.1. Membership of Board, shall be amended to read as follows:

108.1 Board of Appeals Established. The City of Novi Construction Board of Appeals shall sit as
the board of appeals for purposes of this code.

Subhseetion 1093 PenslbyFforvioltions,—<hatHeamended toread-astoHows:-

FOY S Fielation-penattios—Persons—who—shalbiolate—a proviston—ofthis-eode-orshalbHatl—o
comphy-with-any-of-the requirements-thereef-orwhe-shal-erect—installalter—repairordo-work—in
viedationot-the-approved-construction documentsor directive vi-the-code-ofictabor ol a-permn
orcertifieate-tsed-under provisions-of thiscode-shath be cutltv of wmisdemeanor punishable by
a-tne-ofnot-mere-thantive Hundred-Dollars«($300)-or-by-tmprisonment not-exceedingninety
dirs—or-both—steh-4meand-imprsomnent—ach-das—thata—ielation - continuesaherduetiotiee
hits beenserved shial-be deemred-a separate olfense

Section 307. Open Burning and Recreational Fires, shall be amended to read as follows:

Pelinthons—thetolowing-wordsund-terms—shali—tor-the purposes-ot-thissectonund-as—stated
elsenhereinthiscoderhave the meaninesshown-hereins

2



307.2 Permit required. A permit shall be obtained from the fire code official in accordance
with Section 105.6 prior to kindling a fire for recognized silvicultural or range or wildlife
management practices, prevention or control of disease or pests, or a bonfire. Application for
such approval shall only be presented by and permits issued to the owner of the land upon which
the fire is to be kindled.

Exception: Bonfires located within thirty (30) feet of a lake, not exceeding 3°x3’x3” in
size and meeting all other provisions of this code shall be allowed without a permit




AT Lermitregiiredi— Open-burne-shal-be-aHowed-ater obtainine a-permtit-orotherproper
authertzation—trom—the—code—ofhicial forheatineforwarmth-ef-out—workers—and-benfres—not
precHigthecrieritin-Section 23073,

MHS-Location—Hhelocationtor-amy-open-buraing-shall-not-be-less-than S0 rem-any-strueture;
ghd-provistonsshatbbetnadeto-prevent the dire drom spreading towithin 30 olanystrtehire

T T tterdenee — Ay open-burning shat-be-constanth—attended-untH-the firetsextineaished:
Ad—deastone—pertable —Hre—extineusher—with o ammum =\ rating—tvo—portable— Hire
extinguishers—with a-ninimun 2= Asatine—cach—or—otherapproved—on-sie tire oxtnguishing
eeptipettitch-mi—dirt—sandwater - barrel-garden-hose or watertruck, shat-be-avatabletor
nnmediate uthsation,

MLB-Donfire-Nize-aid-Puratiors—-borbire shalbnot-be more than- Hve S -Heet-byvthee 34 el
by five Sy feet dr-dimenston-sndshatbpet-burn-doneerthan theee Sy-hourse Hhe-madmum size
and-duration ed-a-bortire shalbnot-bednereased by the code eiticial unlessttas-determined- it
hre-safety-requirements-efthe situationand-the desirable- duration-of burnwarrant-the-inerease:

307.5 Materials: Fuel for open burning shall consist only of seasoned dry firewood and be
ignited with a small quantity of paper. The use of refuse, waste, trash, garbage, tires,
stumps, cardboard, lumber, furniture, grass, leaves, brush, evergreens, roof covering,
flammable liquids, fabric, cloth or other material not approved by the code official as fuel
is prohibited. Open burning shall not be used for waste disposal purposes.

307.6 Occupational Needs: Open burning for the warmth of workers or heating for
occupational needs shall be confined to an approved noncombustible container or
apparatus to prevent the fire from spreading.

Section 503. Fire department access, shall be amended to read as follows.

503.2 Specifications. Fire apparatus access roads shall be installed and arranged in accordance
with Sections 503.2.1 through 503.2.7 and the City of Novi Design and Construction Standards.

503.2.1 Dimensions. Fire apparatus access roads shall have an unobstructed width of not less
than 20 feet (6096 mm), and an unobstructed vertical clearance of not less than 14 feet (4115
mm).

503.2.2 Authority. The code official shall have the authority to require an increase in the
minimum access widths where they are inadequate for fire or rescue operations.

503.2.3 Surface. Fire apparatus access roads shall be designed and maintained to support the
imposed loads of fire apparatus and shall be surfaced so as to provide all-weather driving
capabilities supporting thirty-five (35) tons.



503.2.4 Turning radius. The minimum required outside turning radius of a fire apparatus access
road shall be fifty (50) feet.

503.2.5 Dead ends. Dead-end fire apparatus access roads in excess of 150 feet (45 720 mm) in
length shall be provided with an approved area for turning around fire apparatus.

503.2.6 Bridges and elevated surfaces. Where a bridge or an elevated surface is part of a fire
apparatus access road, the bridge shall be constructed and maintained in accordance with
AASHTO Standard Specification for Highway Bridges. Bridges and elevated surfaces shall be
designed for a live load sufficient to carry the imposed loads of fire apparatus. Vehicle load
limits shall be posted at both entrances to bridges when required by the code official. Where
elevated surfaces designed for emergency vehicle use are adjacent to surfaces which are not
designed for such use, approved barriers, approved signs or both shall be installed and
maintained when required by the code official.

503.2.7 Grade. The grade of the fire apparatus access road shall be a maximum of eight percent
(8%).

503.2.8 Temporary roadways: Where approved by the code official, temporary fire department
access roadways of such a surface, width, turning radii and vertical clearance which will permit
access by fire apparatus shall be allowed until permanent roads are constructed.

Section 912. Fire Department Connections shall be amended to include the following
subsections:

912.2.3 Proximity to hydrant: In any building or structure required to be equipped with a fire
department connection, the connection shall be located within one hundred (100) feet of a fire
hydrant.

912.7 Alarm Devices: Both an audible and visual means of indicating an automatic sprinkier
system activation shall be mounted above or in close proximity to the fire department
connection.

Geographic Limits. The geographic limits referred to in the following sections of the Fire
Code shall be as follows:

Section 3204.3.1.1 The storage of flammable cryogenic fluids in stationary containers is
prohibited except: (1) as disclosed and permitted by an approved site plan on property
zoned I-2, Heavy Industrial, under the City of Novi Zoning Ordinance or (2) if determined
by the City Fire Marshal to be allowed by the State of Michigan Fire Prevention Code,
Public_ Act No 207 of 1941, as amended, or rules promulgated under that Act, and in
compliance with all other applicable governmental regulations.

Section 3404.2.9.5.1 The storage of Class I and Class 1I liquids in above-ground tanks
outside of buildings is prohibited except: (1) as disclosed and permitted by an approved

5



site_plan_on _property zoned I-2, Heavy Industrial, under the City of Novi Zoning
Ordinance or (2) if determined by the City Fire Marshal to be allowed by the State of
Michigan Fire Prevention Code, Public Act No 207 of 1941, as amended, or rules
promulgated under that Act, and in compliance with all other applicable governmental

regulations.

Section 3406.2.4.4 The storage of Class I and Class II liquids in above-ground tanks is
prohibited except: (1) as disclosed and permitted by an approved site plan on property
zoned I-2, Heavy Industrial, under the City of Novi Zoning Ordinance, (2) if determined
by the City Fire Marshal to be allowed by the State of Michigan Fire Prevention Code,
Public Act No 207 of 1941, as amended, or rules promulgated under that Act, and in
compliance with all other applicable governmental regulations, or (3) in connection with a
temporary activity necessary to the use or development of property in conformity with all
City and other governmental ordinances, laws, permits and approvals.

Section 3804.2 For the protection of heavily populated or congested areas, the capacity
limitations in this Section shall apply to all properties except as disclosed and permitted by
an approved site plan on property zoned I-2, Heavy Industrial, under the City of Novi
Zoning Ordinance.

Sec. 15-18. Fire Chief, Fire Marshal, Authority to issue and serve appearance tickets.

The city fire chief, city fire marshal, and such other person designated by the fire chief, shall
have the authority to issue to and serve upon persons in violation of the provisions of this chapter
appearance tickets in the manner provided in Sections 9a to 9g of Chapter 4 of Act 175 of the
Public Acts of 1927, as amended, MCL 764.9a--764.9g; MSA 28.868(1)--28.868(7).

Sec. 15-19. Authority at fire and other emergencies.

The code official or duly authorized representative, as may be in charge at the scene of a fire or
other emergency involving the protection of life and property, is empowered to direct such
operations as may be necessary to extinguish or control any suspected or reported fires, gas leaks
or other hazardous conditions or situations or of taking any other action necessary in the
reasonable performance of their duty. The code official may prohibit any person, vehicle or
object from approaching the scene and may remove or cause to be removed from the scene any
person, vehicle or object which may impede or interfere with the operations of the fire
department. The code official may remove or cause to be removed any person, vehicle or object
from hazardous areas. All persons ordered to leave a hazardous area shall do so immediately and
shall not re-enter the area until authorized to do so by the code official.

Sec. 15-20. Open buildings due to fire.
The code official or his duly authorized representative is empowered to order the securing of fire
damaged buildings. If the owner of the affected building is present, this order shall be given to

him/her. If no owner or representative of the building is present, the code official or his duly

6



authorized representative may have the building secured. The expense of this securing shall be a
debt to the city from the responsible owner and shall be collected as any other debt to the city.

Sec. 15-21. Interference with fire department operations.

(a) It shall be unlawful to interfere with, attempt to interfere with, conspire to interfere with,
obstruct or restrict the mobility of or block the path of travel of any fire department emergency
vehicle in any way, or to interfere with, attempt to interfere with, conspire to interfere with,
obstruct or hamper any fire department operation.

(b) A person shall not willfully fail or refuse to comply with any lawful order or direction of the
code official or to interfere with the compliance attempts of another individual.

(¢) A vehicle shall not be driven or propelled over any unprotected fire hose of the fire
department when laid down on any street, alleyway, private drive or any other vehicular roadway
without the consent of the code official in command of said operation.

(d) A person shall not without proper authorization from the code official in charge of said fire
department emergency equipment, cling to, attach himself to, climb upon or into, board or swing
upon any fire department emergency vehicle, whether the same is in motion or at rest, or sound
the siren, horn, bell or other sound-producing device thereon, or to manipulate or tamper with, or
attempt to manipulate or tamper with any levers, valves, switches, starting devices, brakes,
pumps or any equipment or protective clothing on, or a part of, any fire department emergency
vehicle.

(e) It shall be unlawful to obscure from view, damage, deface, obstruct or restrict the access to
any fire hydrant or any fire department connection for the pressurization of fire suppression
systems, including fire hydrants and fire department connections located on public or private
streets and access lanes or on private property. If upon the expiration of the time mentioned in a
notice of violation, obstructions or encroachments are not removed, the code official shall
proceed to remove the same. Costs incurred in the performance of necessary work shall be paid
from the municipal treasure, and the legal authority of the municipality shall institute appropriate
action for the recovery of such costs.

(f) A person shall not obstruct, remove, tamper with or otherwise disturb any fire hydrant or fire
appliance required to be installed or maintained under the provisions of the Fire Prevention Code
except for the purpose of extinguishing a fire, training or testing purposes, recharging or making
necessary repairs or when permitted by the code official. Whenever a fire appliance is removed
as herein permitted, it shall be replaced or reinstalled as soon as the purpose for which it was
removed has been accomplished. Defective and non-approved fire appliances or equipment shall
be replaced or repaired as directed by the code official.

(g) A person or persons shall not erect, construct, place or maintain any bumps, fences, gates,
chains, bars, pipes, wood or metal horses or any other type of construction in or on any street,

within the boundaries of the municipality. The word “street” as used in the ordinance, shall

7



mean any roadway accessible to the public for vehicular traffic, including, but not limited to,
private streets or access lanes, as well as all public streets and highways within the boundaries of
the municipality.

Sec. 15-22. Activation of fire protective signaling systems.

A person shall not activate or cause to be activated any fire protective signaling system in any
building or premise within the city, unless a valid fire emergency exists. A fire protective
signaling system is any system which upon activation warns the occupants of the building or
premise that a fire emergency exists or causes the fire department to be summoned.

Sec. 15-23. Sprinkler system control valves.

A sprinkler system sectional control valve shall be provided for each tenant space in Covered
Malls. Existing Covered Malls shall install a sectional control valve for each tenant space that
undergoes a tenant alteration. The sectional control valve shall be electronically supervised shall
be visible from the floor level.

Secs, 15-24 - 15-80 Reserved.

Sec. 15-81. Conflict with other regulations.

The provisions of this article shall not be construed to prevent the enforcement of other
ordinances or regulations which prescribe standards other than those provided in this article. If
any of the provisions of this article are found to be in conflict with the fire prevention code of the
city, the latter code shall be deemed applicable.

Secs. 15-82 - 15-95 Reserved
Part I1.

Savings. This amendment does not affect or impair any act done, offense committed, or right
accruing, accrued, or acquired or liability, penalty, forfeiture, or punishment, pending or incurred
prior to the amendment.

Part 111.

Repealer. All other Ordinances or parts of Ordinances in conflict herewith are hereby repealed
only to the extent necessary to give this Ordinance full force and effect.

Part IV.

Effective Date: Publication. The provisions of this Ordinance shall become effective fifteen
(15) days after its adoption and shall be published within 15 days of its adoption by publication
of a brief notice in a newspaper circulated in the City, stating the date of enactment and the
effective date of the ordinance, a brief statement as to the subject matter of this Ordinance and

8



such other facts as the Clerk shall deem pertinent, and that a copy of the Ordinance is available
for public use and inspection at the office of the City Clerk.

MADE, PASSED AND ADOPTED BY THE NOVI CITY COUNCIL THIS DAY OF
, 2008.

DAVID LANDRY - MAYOR

MARYANNE CORNELIUS — CITY CLERK

Date of Public Hearing
Date of Adoption
Date of Publication of
Notice of Adoption

CERTIFICATE OF ADOPTION

I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and complete copy of the Ordinance passed at the
meeting of the Novi City Council held on the day of
, 2008.

MARYANNE CORNELIUS — CITY CLERK

1042767



Ordinance No. 08-99.14

CLEAN VERSION




CITY OF NOVI
COUNTY OF OAKLAND
STATE OF MICHIGAN

ORDINANCE NO. 08-99.14

AN ORDINANCE TO AMEND CHAPTER 15 OF THE CITY CODE OF
ORDINANCES TO ADOPT THE INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE, 2006
EDITION, BY REFERENCE WITH CERTAIN AMENDMENTS

THE CITY OF NOVI ORDAINS:

Part 1

Article II, Fire Prevention Code, in Chapter 15, Fire Prevention, of the City of Novi Code of
Ordinances, 1s hereby amended to read as follows:

ARTICLE II. FIRE PREVENTION CODE
Sec. 15-16. International Fire Prevention Code — Adopted as amended; insertions

The Intemational Fire Code, 2006 Edition, including the Appendix Chapters, as promulgated and
published by the International Code Council and except as amended herein is hereby adopted by
reference as an Ordinance and Fire Code for the City of Novi, regulating and goveming the
safeguarding of life and property from fire and explosion hazards arising from the storage,
handling and use of hazardous substances, materials and devices, and from conditions hazardous
to life or property in the occupancy of buildings and premises as herein provided; providing for
the 1ssuance of permits and collection of fees therefore, and cach and all of the regulations,
provisions, penalties, conditions and terms of said Fire Code on file in the Office of the Novi
City Clerk are hereby referred to, adopted and made a part hereof, as if fully set out in this
Ordinance, with the amendments and insertions, and subject to the limitations, in the remaining
Sections of this Article.

The following sections of the Fire Code are amended to insert the information indicated.
Section 101.1 Insert “City of Novi.”

Section 109.3 Insert “$500 and/or 90 days in jail.”



Section 111.4 Tnsert “$250 up to $500.”

Sec. 15-17. Amendments.

The Fire Code adopted by reference in section 15-16 is hereby amended in the following
respects:

Subsection 105.1.1. Permits required, shall be amended to read as follows:

Permits are required for the various uses and activities as provided in this code, except in
instances where the use or activity is conducted pursuant to a permit issued by the building
department under the state construction code, as enforced by the city. Permits required under
this code shall be obtained from the code official. Permits shall at all times be kept on the
premises designated therein and shall at all times be subject to inspection by the code official.
Inspections of work and materials for which a permit was obtained shall be made as required by
the authority having jurisdiction or the duly authorized representative.

Subsection 108.1. Membership of Board, shall be amended to read as follows:

108.1 Board of Appeals Established. The City of Novi Construction Board of Appeals shall sit as
the board of appeals for purposes of this code.

Section 307. Open Burning and Recreational Fires, shall be amended to read as follows:

307.2 Permit required. A permit shall be obtained from the fire code official in accordance
with Section 105.6 prior to kindling a fire for recognized silvicultural or range or wildlife
management practices, prevention or control of disease or pests, or a bonfire. Application for
such approval shall only be presented by and permits issued to the owner of the land upon which
the fire is to be kindled.

Exception: Bonfires located within thirty (30) feet of a lake, not exceeding 3’x3’x3’ in
size and meeting all other provisions of this code shall be allowed without a permit

307.5 Materials: Fuel for open burning shall consist only of scasoned dry firewood and be
ignited with a small quantity of paper. The use of refuse, waste, trash, garbage, tires, stumps,
cardboard, lumber, fumiture, grass, leaves, brush, evergreens, roof covering, flammable liquids,
fabric, cloth or other material not approved by the code official as fuel is prohibited. Open
burning shall not be used for waste disposal purposes.

307.6 Occupational Needs: Open burning for the warmth of workers or heating for occupational
needs shall be confined to an approved noncombustible container or apparatus to prevent the fire

from spreading.



Section 503. Fire department access, shall be amended to read as follows.

503.2 Specifications. Fire apparatus access roads shall be installed and arranged in accordance
with Sections 503.2.1 through 503.2.7 and the City of Novi Design and Construction Standards.

503.2.1 Dimensions. Fire apparatus access roads shall have an unobstructed width of not less
than 20 feet (6096 mm), and an unobstructed vertical clearance of not less than 14 feet (4115
mm).

503.2.2 Authority. The code official shall have the authority to require an increase in the
minimum access widths where they are inadequate for fire or rescue operations.

503.2.3 Surface. Fire apparatus access roads shall be designed and maintained Lo support the
imposed loads of fire apparatus and shall be surfaced so as to provide all-weather driving
capabilities supporting thirty-five (35) tons.

503.2.4 Turning radius. The minimum required outside turning radius of a fire apparatus access
road shall be fifty (50) feet.

503.2.5 Dead ends. Dead-end fire apparatus access roads in excess of 150 feet (45 720 mm) in
length shall be provided with an approved area for turning around fire apparatus,

503.2.6 Bridges and elevated surfaces. Where a bridge or an elevated surface is part of a fire
apparatus access road, the bridge shall be constructed and maintained in accordance with
AASHTO Standard Specification for Highway Bridges. Bridges and elevated surfaces shall be
designed for a live load sufficient to cany the imposed loads of fire apparatus. Vehicle load
limits shall be posted at both entrances to bridges when required by the code official. Where
elevated surfaces designed for emergency vehicle use are adjacent to surfaces which are not
designed for such use, approved barriers, approved signs or both shall be installed and
maintained when required by the code official.

503.2.7 Grade. The grade of the fire apparatus access road shall be a maximum of eight percent
(8%).

503.2.8 Temporary roadways: Where approved by the code official, temporary fire department
access roadways of such a surface, width, turning radii and vertical clearance which will permit
access by fire apparatus shall be allowed until permanent roads are constructed.

Section 912. Fire Department Connections shall be amended to include the following
subsections:

912.2.3 Proximity to hydrant. In any building or structure required to be equipped with a fire
department connection, the connection shall be located within one hundred (100) feet of a fire

hydrant.



912.7 Alarm Devices: Both an audible and visual means of indicating an automatic sprinkler
system activation shall be mounted above or in close proximity to the fire department
connection.

Geographic Limits. The geographic limits referred to in the following sections of the Fire Code
shall be as follows:

Section 3204.3.1.1 The storage of flammable cryogenic fluids in stationary containers is
prohibited except: (1) as disclosed and permitted by an approved site plan on property
zoned [-2, Heavy Industrial, under the City of Novi Zoning Ordinance or (2) if
determined by the City Fire Marshal to be allowed by the State of Michigan Fire
Prevention Code, Public Act No 207 of 1941, as amended, or rules promulgated under
that Act, and in compliance with all other applicable governmental regulations.

Section 3404.2.9.5.1 The storage of Class I and Class II liquids in above-ground tanks
outside of buildings is prohibited except: (1) as disclosed and permitted by an approved
site plan on property zoned I-2, Heavy Industrial, under the City of Novi Zoning
Ordinance or (2) if determined by the City Fire Marshal to be allowed by the State of
Michigan Fire Prevention Code, Public Act No 207 of 1941, as amended, or rules
promulgated under that Act, and in compliance with all other applicable governmental
regulations.

Section 3406.2.4.4 The storage of Class I and Class II liquids in above-ground tanks is
prohibited except: (1) as disclosed and permitted by an approved site plan on property
zoned -2, Heavy Industrial, under the City of Novi Zoning Ordinance, (2) if determined
by the City Fire Marshal to be allowed by the State of Michigan Fire Prevention Code,
Public Act No 207 of 1941, as amended, or rules promulgated under that Act, and in
compliance with all other applicable governmental regulations, or (3) in connection with
a temporary activity necessary to the use or development of property in conformity with
all City and other governmental ordinances, laws, permits and approvals.

Section 3804.2 For the protection of heavily populated or congested areas, the capacity
[imitations 1n this Section shall apply to all properties except as disclosed and permitted by an
approved site plan on property zoned I-2, Heavy Industrial, under the City of Novi Zoning
Ordinance.

Sec. 15-18. Fire Chief, Fire Marshal, Authority to issue and serve appearance tickets,
The city fire chief, city fire marshal, and such other person designated by the fire chief, shall
have the authority to issue to and serve upon persons in violation of the provisions of this chapter

appearance tickets in the manner provided in Sections 9a to 9g of Chapter 4 of Act 175 of the
Public Acts of 1927, as amended, MCL 764.9a--764.9g, MSA 28.868(1)--28.868(7).

Sec. 15-19. Authority at fire and other emergencies.



The code official or duly authorized representative, as may be in charge at the scene of a fire or
other emergency involving the protection of life and property, is empowered to direct such
operations as may be necessary to extinguish or control any suspected or reported fires, gas leaks
or other hazardous conditions or situations or of taking any other action necessary in the
reasonable performance of their duty. The code official may prohibit any person, vehicle or
object from approaching the scene and may remove or cause to be removed from the scene any
person, vehicle or object which may impede or interfere with the operations of the fire
department. The code official may remove or cause to be removed any person, vehicle or object
from hazardous areas. All persons ordered to leave a hazardous area shall do so immediately and
shall not re-enter the area until authorized to do so by the code official.

Sec. 15-20. Open buildings due to fire.

The code official or his duly authorized representative is empowered to order the securing of fire
damaged buildings. If the owner of the affected building 1s present, this order shall be given 1o
him/her. If no owner or representative of the building is present, the code official or his duly
authorized representative may have the building secured. The expense of this securing shall be a
debt to the city from the responsible owner and shall be collected as any other debt to the city.

Sec. 15-21. Interference with fire department operations.

(a) It shall be unlawful to interfere with, attempt to interfere with, conspire to interfere with,
obstruct or restrict the mobility of or block the path of travel of any fire department emergency
vehicle in any way, or to interfere with, attempt to interfere with, conspire to interfere with,
obstruct or hamper any fire department operation,

(b) A person shall not willfully fail or refuse to comply with any lawful order or direction of the
code official or to interfere with the compliance attempts of another individual.

(¢) A vehicle shall not be driven or propelled over any unprotected fire hose of the fire
department when laid down on any street, alleyway, private drive or any other vehicular roadway
without the consent of the code official in command of said operation.

(d) A person shall not without proper authorization from the code official in charge of said fire
department emergency equipment, cling to, attach himself to, climb upon or into, board or swing
upon any fire department emergency vehicle, whether the same 1s in motion or at rest, or sound
the siren, horn, bell or other sound-producing device thereon, or to manipulate or tamper with, or
attempt to manipulate or tamper with any levers, valves, switches, starting devices, brakes,
pumps or any equipment or protective clothing on, or a part of, any fire department emergency
vehicle.

(e) Tt shall be unlawful to obscure from view, damage, deface, obstruct or restrict the access to
any fire hydrant or any fire department connection for the pressurization of fire suppression
systems, including fire hydrants and fire department connections located on public or private
streets and access lanes or on private property. If upon the expiration of the time mentioned in a

5



notice of violation, obstructions or encroachments are not removed, the code official shall
proceed to remove the same. Costs incurred in the performance of necessary work shall be paid
from the municipal treasure, and the legal authority of the municipality shall institute appropriate
action for the recovery of such costs.

(f) A person shall not obstruct, remove, tamper with or otherwise disturb any fire hydrant or fire
apphiance required to be installed or maintained under the provisions of the Fire Prevention Code
except for the purpose of extinguishing a fire, training or testing purposes, recharging or making
necessary repairs or when permitted by the code official. Whenever a fire appliance is removed
as herein permitted, it shall be replaced or reinstalled as soon as the purpose for which it was
removed has been accomplished. Defective and non-approved fire appliances or equipment shall
be replaced or repaired as directed by the code official.

(g) A person or persons shall not erect, construct, place or maintain any bumps, fences, gates,
chains, bars, pipes, wood or metal horses or any other type of construction in or on any street,
within the boundaries of the municipality. The word “street” as used in the ordinance, shall
mean any roadway accessible to the public for vehicular traffic, including, but not limited to,
private streets or access lanes, as well as all public streets and highways within the boundaries of

the municipality.
Sec. 15-22. Activation of fire protective signaling systems.

A person shall not activate or cause to be activated any fire protective signaling system in any
building or premise within the city, unless a valid fire emergency exists. A fire protective
signaling system 1s any system which upon activation warns the occupants of the building or
premise that a fire emergency exists or causes the fire department to be summoned.

Sec. 15-23. Sprinkler system control valves.

A sprinkler system sectional control valve shall be provided for each tenant space in Covered
Malls. Existing Covered Malls shall install a sectional control valve for each tenant space that
undergoes a tenant alteration. The sectional control valve shall be electronically supervised shall
be visible from the floor level.

Secs. 15-24 - 15-80  Reserved.

Sec. 15-81. Conflict with other regulations.

The provisions of this article shall not be construed to prevent the enforcement of other
ordinances or regulations which prescribe standards other than those provided in this article. 1If

any of the provisions of this article are found to be in conflict with the fire prevention code of the
city, the latter code shall be deemed applicable.

Secs. 15-82 - 15-95 Reserved

Part I1.



Savings. This amendment does not affect or impair any act done, offense committed, or right
accruing, accrued, or acquired or liability, penalty, forfeiture, or punishment, pending or incurred
prior to the amendment.

Part I11.

Repealer. All other Ordinances or parts of Ordinances in conflict herewith are hereby repealed
only to the extent necessary to give this Ordinance full force and effect.

Part IV.

Effective Date: Publication. The provisions of this Ordinance shall become effective fiflieen
(15) days after its adoption and shall be published within 15 days of its adoption by publication
of a brief notice in a newspaper circulated in the City, stating the date of enactment and the
effective date of the ordinance, a brief statement as to the subject matter of this Ordinance and
such other facts as the Clerk shall deem pertinent, and that a copy of the Ordinance is available
for public use and nspection at the office of the City Clerk.

MADE, PASSED AND ADOPTED BY THE NOVI CITY COUNCIL THIS DAY OF
, 2008.

DAVID LANDRY - MAYOR

MARYANNE CORNELIUS - CITY CLERK

Date of Adoption
Date of Publication of
Notice of Adoption

CERTIFICATE OF ADOPTION

I hereby certify that the foregoing is true and complete copy of the Ordinance passed at the
meeting of the Novi City Council held on the day of
, 2008.

MARYANNE CORNELIUS - CITY CLERK

1042767



	Fire Chief's Recommendation
	Strike Out Version
	Clean Version

